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Who but » mother would make such 
nacrilices, drain her very life-blood, all 
her energy, everythin*, for her children, 
and yet never ask for or expect compen­
sation?

There ia no one in the average family, 
the value of whose services begun, to 
eom|»are with those of the mother, and 
yet there is no one who is more gener 
ally neglected or taken advantage of. 
She must always remain at home even­
ings, and look after the children, when 
the others are out having a good time. 
Her cares never cease. She is responsible 
for the housework, fur the preparation 
of meals I she has the children’s clothes 
to make or mend, there is company to be 
entertained, darning to be done, and a 
score of little duties which nt 1 often 
be attended to at odd moment », 4ched
from her busy days, and she if a up 
working long after every one ei.e in the 
house is asleep.

No matter how loving or thoughtful 
the father may be, the heavier burdens, 
the greater anxieties, the weightier re­
sponsibilities of the home, of the children, 
always fall on the mother. Indeed, the 
very virtues of the good mother are a 
constant temptation to the other mem­
bers of the family, especially the sellinli 
ones, to take advantage of her. If she 
were not so kind, so affectionate and ten­
der, so considerate, so generous and ever 
ready to make all sorts of sacrifices for 
others; if she were not so willing to 
efface herself ; if she were more self- 
assertive; if she stood up for and de­
manded her rights, she would have a 
much easier time.

lfut the members of the average 
family seem to take it for granted that 
they can put all their burdens on the 
patient, uncomplaining mother ; that she 
will always do anything to help out, m. 
to enable the children to have a good 
time; and in many homes, sad to say, 
the mother, just because of her good­
ness, is shamefully imposed upon and 
neglected. “Oh, mother won’t mind, 
mother will stay at home." How often 
we hear remarks like this from thought­
less children I

It is always the poor mother on whom 
the burden falls; and the pathetic thing 
is that she rarely gets much credit or

Many mothers in the poor and work­
ing classes practically sacrifice all that 
most people hold dearest in life for their 
children. They deliberately impair their 
health, wear themselves out, make all 
sorts of sacrifices, to send a worthless 
boy to college. They take in washing, go 
out house-cleaning, do the hardest and 
most menial work, in order to give their 
boys and girls an education and the 
benefit of priceless opportunities that 
they never had; yet, how often, they are 
rewarded only with total indifference and 
neglect I

Some time ago I heard of a young girl, 
beautiful, gay, full of spirit and vigor, 
who married and had four children. The 
husband died penniless, and the mother 
made the most heroic efforts to educate 
the children. By dint of unremitting toil 
and unheard of sacrifices and private 
she succeeded in sending the boys to col­
lege and the girls to a boarding-school. 
“When they came home, pretty, refined 
girls and strong young men, abreast with 
all the new ideas and tastes of their 
times, she was a worn-out, common­
place old woman. They had their own 
pursuits and companions. She lingered 
among them for two or three years and 
then died, of some sudden failure of the 
brain. The shock woke them to con 
sciousness of the truth. They hung 
over her, as she lay unconscious, in an 
agony of grief. The oldest son, as he 
held her in his arms, cried : ‘You have 
been a good mother to us!’ Her fat- 
colore ! again, her eyes kindled into a 
smile, and she whispered: ‘You never 
said so before, John.’ Their the light 
died out, and she was gone.”

Who can ever de'.ict the tragedies that 
have been enacted in the hearts of Can­
adian mothers wl o have suffered untold 
tortures from m gleet, indifference, and 
lack of appréciât on.

What a pathetic story of neglect many 
a mother's letters from her grown-up 
children could tell! A few scraggy lines, 
a few sentences now and then, hurriedly 
written and mailed — often to ease n
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