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ous laboratories are very different, and most of them are 
very unsatisfactory. The slump test has probably been the 
most popular, and is being adopted officially by some promi­
nent committees, but the objections entered against it are 
serious. The flow table, tilting chute and other tests have 
more or less merit, but engineers do not agree in regard to 
their relative usefulness. They do not agree, to begin with, 
on the relation between consistency, flowability and slump. 
The so-called “flow table,” devised by G. M. Williams, of the 
U.S. Bureau of Standards, holds forth cosiderable promise as 
an improvetnent on the slump test, and all engineers who are 
interested in concrete work, will desire to know more about 
the flow table, and no doubt a number of those who have 
laboratory facilities under their control will be interested in 
obtaining detailed information such as would enable them to 
construct experimental flow tables for their own work. We 
are very pleased to be able to announce that Mr. Williams 
has promised us an article on flow-table tests for an early 
issue.
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Construction Work, by J-

Ç1 HOULD an architect or an engineer have charge of the 
O design and construction of bridges and other important 
structures.. The question was recently brought to the atten­
tion of the U.S. Engineering Council by the American So­
ciety of Civil Engineers and by the American Institute of 
Consulting Engineers. Each of these two organizations had 
adopted formal resolutions expressing its belief that engi­
neers should have charge of design and construction of 
bridges and other structures in which engineering elements 
predominate. Occasion for these resolutions was given by 
the engagement not many months ago of architects to have 
charge of the design and construction of certain prominent 
bridges in Pennsylvania.

This perplexing problem has been considered by a joint 
committee of Engineering Council and the American Insti­
tute of Architects. After a full and frank discussion of 
the points at issue, the committee composed of three engi­
neers and three architects, all of whom were present, 
unanimously concluded that the special conditions surround­
ing each case should determine whether an architect or an 
engineer should be selected to have charge.

Whether an engineer or an architect has the primary en­
gagement for a project on which the services of both are 
needed, an important requirement, frequently neglected, is 
that the collaboration should date from the beginning. Each 
should be given fair credit for his contribution to the com­
pleted structure.
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CONCRETE MIXTURES?

DO CONSISTENCY AND 
STRENGTH OF
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FAILURES IN CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

Sir,—Referring to letters published in the April 22nd 
29th issues of The Canadian Engineer, entitled, “Failuresand

in Concrete Construction,” that of R. E. W. Hagarty is 
certainly unfortunate. The opening paragraphs of his letter 
would indicate that he had no faith at all in concrete, how­
ever designed and constructed, but he ends up with the state­
ment that concrete “undoubtedly constitutes one of the most 
permanent, economical, safe and fireproof methods of build­
ing that the world has yet produced.”

The ten mistakes recited by Mr. Hagarty are not per­
petrated by well-known contractors who have a reputation to 

Moreover, specifications cover these points andsustain.
they constitute nothing more than common sense in concrete 
construction. They are not being generally violated, as one 
would be led to believe by Mr. Hagarty.

Instead of constituting “an optical illusion,” and being 
“probably the greatest piece of engineering camouflage which
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