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Point of Order

complaints from Canadians in Calgary, Alberta who cannot get 
the time of day on immigration matters from members of 
Parliament. It pleases me, finally, to see the member of Parlia­
ment stand up for his constituents.

I must say that yesterday, for the first time since I became a 
member of Parliament, I was not very proud to be a parlia­
mentarian. I was not very proud because, as we know, a few days 
ago the Supreme Court asked us to discuss one of the most 
important issues for the future of our society, and I am referring 
to equal treatment of same sex spouses.

I feel I must draw your attention to the fact that yesterday 
evening, some very discriminatory, hateful and offensive state­
ments were made concerning the homosexual community, and 
we can hardly say the homosexual community benefited from 
the kind of debate we had yesterday.

ALZHEIMER’S REGISTRY

Mrs. Jane Stewart (Brant, Lib.): Mr. Speaker, the solicitor 
general and the Minister of Health have recently announced the 
creation of a national registry for Canadians with Alzheimer’s. I 
would ask the solicitor general to explain to the House the 
intention of the registry. Could he tell us who is going to manage 
the system and explain the government’s expectations as to the 
impact the registry will have on Canadians with Alzheimer’s 
and members of their families?

My main point is, and I will give a very specific example, that 
I always saw the role of the Chair as allowing a maximum of 
freedom of expression, and I must say that you and your team 
have always scrupulously abided by this principle. However, I 
feel I must draw your attention to the fact that in the course of 
the debate yesterday evening, the hon. member for Calgary 
Northeast made some comparisons that were extremely danger­
ous and very difficult to accept for parliamentarians, and I think 
that if we do not put a stop to this and if we do not call to order 
members who take the liberty of making comparisons which I 
find deeply offensive between the homosexual community and 
certain rights to which I am committed on their behalf, the 
reputation of this institution will be tarnished.

Hon. Herb Gray (Leader of the Government in the House 
of Commons and Solicitor General of Canada, Lib.): Mr. 
Speaker, the registry is intended to help locate and identify 
missing individuals with Alzheimer’s or related conditions. It 
will help to ensure that the risk to them because of their 
condition is mitigated and limited. It will also reassure their 
families and caregivers.

I am very pleased that we could work on this project together 
with the Alzheimer’s Society of Canada and the department of 
health. The program will be managed by the Alzheimer’s 
Society of Canada and its branches across the country. It will use 
the RCMP’s Canadian police information computer system.

I think this is a wonderful example of police-community 
co-operation. I am very glad that the federal government has 
been able to facilitate the project.

In concluding, I simply want to bring to your attention a 
comment that will give some indication of the very distressing 
tenor of yesterday’s debate, at least in the case of the hon. 
member for Calgary Northeast. Very briefly: “Homosexuality, 
to anyone who has not been brainwashed by the last decade of 
effective propagandizing by the gay lobby, is unnatural".

I finally want to say that I am not acting on behalf of any lobby 
whatsoever. In presenting a motion I felt was important, I was 
acting as a parliamentarian in order to raise one of those issues 
which, as you know, requires more than one debate.

• (1200)

The Speaker: Colleagues, this would bring to a conclusion 
the question period. I have notice of a question of privilege from 
the hon. member for Hochelaga—Maisonneuve.

In concluding, I want to say that I do not believe that in this 
Parliament or anywhere else, those who are involved in promot­
ing gay rights have been brainwashed.

[Translation]
The Speaker: Dear colleagues, I do not believe that this is a 

matter of privilege. I would ask all of you, regardless of the 
topic being debated, to always make judicious word choices 
because sometimes we are confronted with ideas that are not 
always acceptable to all individuals.

POINT OF ORDER

COMMENTS BY MEMBER FOR CALGARY NORTHEAST

Mr. Réal Ménard (Hochelaga—Maisonneuve, BQ): Thank 
you, Mr. Speaker. I will let you be the judge and decide whether 
this is a question of privilege or a point of order, but as you 
know, the matter I wish to raise is connected to the fact that 
yesterday, we had the second hour of debate on a motion I 
presented earlier in April in which I urged the government to 
recognize same sex spouses.

As you know, in this House, we use strong words and express 
strong opinions, and sometimes, we use unusually strong words. 
But, in this instance, I have not read the record of the debate. I 
will read those statements in context and will watch the video to 
find out more. If necessary, I will report back to the House with 
my decision on the matter.


