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tgo out te, New Caledonia and be marnied, to

mtake an application to that effect througli the

governor. Elderly women *are always very

Prompt in making such applications; but they
are not entertained. The matrimonial candi-
dates muet be young, and exempt from physical

'flfirmities. Girls under long sentences readily

Catch at this method of escaping from the intol.
erable tedium of prison life ; and the pretty ones

Are certain te, be put on tlie governor's list, no

'natter liow frightful may be the crimes for

'*hicli they have been sentenced. The only

Uloral qualification requisite is to have passed
aM least two yeare in the penitentiary.

The selected candidates have te, sign engage-

lItent. promising to marry éonvicts and to settle

111 New Caledonia for the remainder of their

lUtTes. On these conditions, govcrnment trans-

Ports tliem, gives them a decent outfit, and a
ticket..of..leave when they land at Noumea.

Their marriages are arranged for them by the
governor of the colony, who lias a selection of
*ell.-behaved, convicts ready for them te, choose
fromn; and each girl may consult lier own fancy
*ithin certain limite, for the proportion of mar-
riageable men te, women is about three to one.
Of course, if a girl declares that none of the
aspirant bridegrooms submitted te, her inspec-
tioDn have met with lier approval, the governor
eau1 only slirug hie eboulders in the usual Frenchi
W1ay. It lias happened more than once that
PrettY girls have been wooed by warders,
free settlers, or time-expired soldiers and
8 ailors, instead of by convicts. In sucli
eas5es, the governor can only assent te, a mar-
rnage on condition that the female convict's
free lover shahl place himself in the position of

a ticket-of..leave man, and undertake neyer te
laethe colony. Love works wonders; and

tliere is no instance on record of a man having
refused. te, comply witli tliese conditions wlien
0 1Ce lie liad fallen In love. There are some in-
statices, thougli, of the authorities having de-
cliuled te let a female convict marry a free man,
*hen tliey were not convinced that the latter

*sa person of firmi character and kindly dis-
position. For the women's own sakes it is
1 1'ecessary that they should not be married te,
14ln who would be likely, in some moment of
tSIKIPer, te, fiing tlieir diereputable antecedents
lIlto their teeth. There is nothlng of this kind
tO fear when a female convict gets wedded te a
41ll wliose past life lias been as bad as lier own.

Wliy the Frencli government ehould have
8lddled itself witli the responsibility.of promot-
riIg marriages among convicts it le difficuît to

SaY; but the experiment lias, on the whole,
Yielded very good resuits. The married couples
&et hluts and free grants of land, and ail that
theY Can draw from it by their own labor be-
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cornes theirs. Durlng five years tbey are euh-
jected to, the obligation of reporting themeelves,
weekly at the district police office; and they are
forbidden to enter public houges, and muet not
be found out of doors at night. This proba-
tionary period being satisfactorily passed, they
get their fuit freedom, but subject always to the
condition of remaining in the colony. To this
rule the law has distinctly forbidden that any
exception shall be made. On no account what-
ever must convicts who have accepted grants of
]and and contracted 4"administrative mar-
niages,", as they are called, ever return to
France. They are at ]iberty, however, to send
their children to, France if any respectable per
son in that country will become answerable for
them, and undertake to provide themn with a
good education. The sons of convicte are born
French subjects, and will be required at tbe age
of twenty to draw at the conscription, and serve
their appointed terme in the army.

From what precedes It may be inferred that
the lot of convicts in New Caledonia is a fairly
pleasant one; but we have spoken as yet only of
those convicts who have tickets-of-leave, and
are more or less free t, roain over the whole
Island. Those who have not earned tickets-of-
leave are kept in the penal settiement of the
Island of Nou, or are employed on public works,
road-making, house-building,etc.,in gangs, mov-
ing and encamping from place te place dnning
the fine season under military escort. The lot
even of these convicts cannot be called a hard
one, as compared with that of convicts in other
countries, and of French ronvicts under the old
system of bagnes, or transportation te, Cayenne.
The climate of Cayenne was so, deadly that all
the convicts transported there either died or
contracted incurable maladies. As for the old
bagnes of Brest and Toulon, they were very
hells, where the convicte were kept chained in
couples, and were treated pretty mucl ike wild
beasts. The climate of New Caledonla, on the
eontrary, le deliglitful, and the soil of the differ-
ent islande composing the colony is s0 fertile
that corn, fruit, and vegetables grow there in
abundance, and can be had very cheap. In 18 73
an attempt te, cultivate vines was commenced;
but hitherte the expeniment lias not met with
success. It is said, however, that the difficulties
which have beset the vine.growers will be over-
corne in tiine.

We are aware that the accounts given of New
Caledonia by political convicts like MM. Henri
Roclifort and Paschal Groueset, have bten unfa-
vorable; but the statements of these gentlemen
must be accepted wltli reserve. The National
Âssembly in 1872 most unwisely decided that
the political convicts-thirteen thoueand in
number-should flot be compelled to work ; and
the conseqilence was, thatliving in idleness, and
being anxious te, give the authorities as much
trouble as possible, they suffered, from the dis-
order and general aqualor which they created.
On arnivlng in the oolony they grumblod at flid-


