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Ciermanî e is something more than that. He is a liar of
the int ater and, from ail indications, a hireling liar. For
teProof of it, let the reader spend an indignant haif-hour

Mve th pages of Hedin's recent book," With the German
Arisi the West." H1e wiil see there our British soldiers

dePitedas nilserable mercenaries, fighting in ignorance,
wimndeinglu dull apathy, and branded with the mark of
the ireingcoward; lie will find the Germans shown as a
nainof beroe, animated from the highest to the lowest by

a 8 0ri f devotion, and at their head an Emperor drawn in
* ous luminous that nothing but the gold of the Germai

war-hestcould have supplied Hedin with the tints of it.
Gennancruelty and atrocity that has horrified the world is

ffdnbehind a tissue of fabrication. "The book," says the
IÀdnMon&ing Post, "stiuics aloud (sic) of bribery and cor-

ruPton-It is the sliîiest saurian, shedding crocodile's tears
of a libèflous panegyrie which ever trailed its many-jointed

If9 out of the cesspools of the Reptile Press." More Power
êOte Momng Po8t for its straiglit speakiug. The onlY
ertof lledin's book is that it lias inspired Mr. E. V. Lucas

to wri his gay and glorious parody, " in Genttest Ger-
=y," a work that we heartily couimend to every good
patlit wlth a sense of humour. The Geographical Society

hm done weII. Sven liedin is unllt to break bread, or even
*oslit an infinitive, with any deceut geographer.

IEUNI VERSITY MAGAZINE would nover wish, in its
eiItorial aspect, wo exercis an unduc influence ove?

th presidenit& elections of the United States. Whi
we qxa of Colonel Roosevelt or Profeffser Wilson WC must
bc carful. But there are certain puae li Colonel Rooseý-
vd1t's speech at Platt-sburg on Augut 25 last, which c111

torth our admiration to a degree which b)ids defiance to ou?

edilorial discretion, It is long smnc we have read any ad-

dn more resonant with courage or more lnspirlng i itsi
fec8, we mighit aimost Bay itm. defiant, pstriotism. 11n thie

av of tIfinervin< politicians it Is cberng tW flnd a man


