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Open skies would let ail members of
NATO and the Warsaw Pact participate
fully in arms control verification and
monitoring.

Satellites are inadequate
to the verification tasks
ahead

The rapid pace of negotiationis for the
Conventionai arms control agreement
Proposed by Mr. Bush and endorsed at
the NATO summit meeting adds to the
Importance of open skies. Since open
skies is a straightforward concept, it can
be easily and readily available to assist
in verification as soon as an agreemenlt
is reached.

OnIy large countries have satellites in
the skies. Yet, if we are to have conven-
tional arms control in Europe, it is essen-
tial that ail parties to the agreement have
the ability to assure their publics, on the
basis of their own judgments, that these
agreements are being adhered to, and
that their security is intact.

It is not politically acceptable to rely
solely on the good will and judgment of
another nAtinn Thp 1lIS woild fot do

contlnucus monitoring to prevent a rapid
military build-up and to maintain confi-
dence that a surprise attack is not being
planned. If we remain subject to signifi-
cent periods during which our monitoring
capabllity is impaired, our confidence in
these agreements will diminish.

By his actions, Mikhaffl Gorbachev has

clemonstrated his commilment to
improve East-West relations. He has
oftered to do more and has put forward
a wide array of proposais that will fur-
ther change the relationship. President
Bush has wisely asked him to create the
conditions that will enable us to move
ahead together without risking the secu-
rity of NATO and the Warsaw Pact. 13

PM Welcomes Bush Initiative
The Prime Minister, the Right
Honourable Brian Mulroney, recently
welcomed the initiative of President
George Bush in proposing an agreement
on "Open Skies." He also indicated that
Canada would be willing to join in an
"Open Skies" arrangement that would
allow for short notice overflights of
Canadian territory by unarmed aircraft.
Traditionally, he stated, this concept has
symbolized the West's commitment to
transparency. It serves as a clear reminder
of our interest in both arms control and
peaceful cooperation wlth the East.


