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The Tidal Phenomena
Tag tides of this Bay have beon

long and generally noted for the ex-
traordinary height to which they rise,
as well as for the rapidity with which
the waters ebb and flow. Their pecu,
liar rise, seventy feet, may in a mea-
sure be attributed to the bell-mouthed
shape of the Bay, and other local
causes ; the rush of the tidal waters of
the Atlantic against the rocky walls
of Nova Scotia, New Brunswick, and
the State of Maine, brings the tides
almost to a stand still, when it has to
turn nearly at right angles, and enter
the Bay of Fundy with a more thar.
doublevelocity.

But what appears most strange is,
that ihe tid es are either on the rise or
the land is settling ; one of the two
must have taken place long ago, and
still seems to continue. Professor
Dawson asserts in his Acadian Geolo-
gy that a change has taken place ;-
that the thousands of acres of what la

of the Bay of Fundy,
now called marsh, s2tuate on the vari-
ous arms of the Bay of Fundy, was
once covered with a growth of spruce,
pine and other wood, that wili not
grow on lands overflowed by salt
water; and Hugh Miller asserts the
saine phenomena to have taken place
on the coast of the British Islands.-
The change in both countries appears
to be about the same, twenty-five to
thirty feet, onlv of a reverse order ; in
Britain it would appear that either the
land had rose twenty-five or thirty
feet, or the sea bad settled that much;
in America, or rather thic section of
it, the contrary appears to be the case.
However, it may be possible that both
operauons, namely, the rising or the
settling o(the waters, or the rising or
settling of the lands, may have been
taking place at the same time. In
corroboration of these statements we
have frenquently been informed by
those whe have been engaged in the


