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IV. Little Brother Rabbit

One autumn Wesakchak felt very sad. All 
through the summer there had been no rain. The 
prairie grass was burnt brown and dry. The little 
streams had grown smaller and narrower, until at 
last not a drop of water was left. The animals, 
finding no grass to eat and no water to drink, had 
all gone to the far north-west, where the Great River 
came down from the mountains. For they knew 
that along its banks they would find grass to eat. 
Wesakchak wondered if the Great Spirit were 
angry with the people of the plains when He sent 
them these long, hot days and nights. Why did He 
let the animals go away from them, leaving the 
hunters no game to kill ? The little children were 
crying for food, and the warriors had grown thin 
and sad during this summer. And now the fever 
had come, and in the lodges many sick wore 
lying.

Wesakchak felt that he must do something for 
his people, so he asked the Great Spirit to show 
him where the animals lived, so that he might tell 
his hunters and save the lives of all in the tribe. 
Then Wesakchak took his canoe and carried it 
until he came to the Great River. Getting in, he 
paddled for many days and many nights. He


