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- CD/CW/WP.194, dated 18 March 1988, submitted by the delegation of the 
German Democratic Republic, entitled "Chemical weapons convention: provisions 
to ensure the confidentiality of information provided in connection with 
verification activities".

- CD/CW/WP.195, dated 22 March 1988, submitted by the delegation of the 
German Democratic Republic, entitled "Article VI: Regime for chemicals in 
Schedule [1]".

- CD/CW/WP.196 (also issued as CD/821), dated 29 March 1988, entitled 
"Letter dated 28 March 1988 from the representative of the Union of Soviet 
Socialist Republics to the President of the Conference on Disarmament 
transmitting a text of the Statement of the Ministry of Foreign Affairs of the 
USSR on 16 March 1988".

- CD/CW/WP.197 (also issued as CD/822), dated 29 March 1988, submitted by 
the delegations of the Federal Republic of Germany and Italy, entitled "The 
order of destruction of chemical weapons".

- CD/CW/WP.198, dated 5 April 1988, submitted by the delegation of the 
German Democratic Republic, entitled "Chemical Weapons Convention: on-site 
inspection on challenge - guidelines on the International Inspectorate".

- CD/CW/WP. 19 9, dated 7 April 1988, submitted by the delegation of France, 
entitled "Security stocks: proposed amendments".

- CD/CW/WP.200, dated 15 April 1988, entitled "Draft Special Report of the 
Ad Hoc Conmittee on Chemical Weapons to the Conference on Disarmament".

- CD/CW/WP.201 (also issued as CD/830), dated 19 April 1988. entitled 
"Letter dated 18 April 1988 from the Representative of the United States of 
America addressed to the President of the Conference on Disarmament 
transmitting the text of a document entitled 1 Information presented to the 
visiting Soviet delegation at the Tooele Army Depot, 18-21 November 1987'".

- CD/CW/WP.202, dated 8 July 1988, entitled "Progranroe of work for the 
second part of the 1988 session".

- CD/CW/WP.203, dated 19 July 1988, submitted by the delegation of the 
Netherlands, entitled "Provision of data relevant to the chemical weapons 
convention".

- CD/CW/WP.204, dated 19 July 1988, submitted by the delegation of the 
Federal Republic of Germany, entitled "Verification of non-production of 
chemical weapons: ‘Sample Now, Analyse Later* (SNAL) system for the 
retrospective verification of non-production".

- CD/CW/WP.205 (also issued as CD/849), dated 28 July 1988, submitted by 
the delegation of the United States of America, entitled "Destruction of 
Chemical Weapons Production Facilities".

- CD/CW/WP.206, dated 10 August 1988, submitted by the delegation of the 
United Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern Ireland, entitled "Provision of 
data relevant to the Chemical weapons Convention".


