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lu the remarks, in our issue of the
llth of October, 1884,. under this
head, we spoke more particnlarly of
the àkili, necessary in a Worshipful
Master to ensure the sidccess cf the
lodge over 'which lie lid to preeide.
A more knowledge of the words of the
rituel, we tb.eu pointed out, vas net
ail that was neededto entitie a brether
te the higlist ranli among hie fel.
lows, but rather an ability satisfatoi'-
ily te preside over the meetings of his
loage, whether engagea ini labor or et

refrelient ILMay truly lie Baid
that the Worshipful Master for the
time being je the corner-atone on
which the whole fabric of hie lodge
iests-that on hie skiil and abulity
dlepende, net only the welfare cf the
loage, but the comfort and happinese
cf ite members. How necessary then
je it that every candidate eelected for
thre Master's chair should lie abls te
carry eut thre duties required, of 14m
ln a satiefactory manner. In our
ooing remarlis on this subject, in

t~he issue te which we have alreedly
referred, ws proraised te devote sorne
attention te thre relationship of tirs
'Worshipfnl Master of a lodge te hie
l'est masters, ana it ks our intention
on the present occasion te redesm
that promise. We have already said
that a Wors3hipfnl Master should lie
rnler in his own lodge, net geverning,
however, with a rodl cf iron, but
raLlier by iduduess, and it ks w1tl the
l'ast Masters cf hie lodge that lie may
fin& thre greatest diffioulty, or, if
properly managea, from 'whom hie
may obtain the greatest assistance.
Englishmen are seldoma slow te show
respect for the experiencq gained by
their seniors, and few Englihmen
more fuily recognize this principle
than Freenaseons. Yet cases 'will
arise k' -whlch a newly-appointedl
brother =ny considler hie own ability'
epua, if net superior, te that of the
bretbran of bis lodge Whe hâve badl
thre avantage of otuLI exporie nce in

the wvork which loie j freeh to, auci
some wvil even go. go far as teo urge
their opinion against that of the oldl
and tried members of thé lodge. We
are net wholly opposed te this course,
because unless a littie spirit ks ehown
by each sncceing Master, a lodge&
niay mn the risk of dying from inani-
tion, but great ekilli k neceseary te
decide how far the spirit of ';ebilIion,
may cafely -be carried. The Past
Masters of a lodge have ne doubt a
dlaim te be considered, ana their
opinion ehould le resp,)cted, but only
so far as a MËster may feel he oaa
coincide ini their views, or at least
an1y se fer as their views nIai not be,
in exact opposition te*is o'qn, je it.
safe for him te go without some indç-'
pendent advice. Ho ks the Master of
the lodge, loie j responeible for its
welfare, and lie alone wiil le to blame
if any experiment resuits unfavorably.
It wiIl be no use for hlm, te plead lie.
acted on the advice of t'ho lest Mas-
ters; lie was placed in hie position.
te manage the moage; lie accepted the
office well knowing the*rosponsibilities
attaohed, te it, and muet lie as equally
prepared te meet any complainte as.
he je te listen to eulogistic compli-
ments. True, the l'est Masters will
net desert hlma in an emergency, but
between the lay members of bis lodge,
and those wlio hAve passed the chair,
there je often a great guif, ana when
snobi dose exist ii is the Worshipful
Master 'whe je kt oked. upon as the
bridge which ehali nits the two sec-
tions ; therefore it je well te remem-
ber that any question on which there
ks likely te lie a difference of opinion
independent action je necessary more
than et any other time, but thie in-
dependent action muet not usuaily
ho oarriedlte extremes ; a conciliatory
course je possible, and in the arra nge-
ment of this the Worahipful Master
wiil have ample oppertunity for dis-
playing that ekill se essentiel in o.
ruler of the Craftw-Ftecnao7.,' 07&rom-
icle.
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