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The Budget-Mr. Grafftey

have already said, ta defend and lead the
federal cause. Before we have constitutional
modernization we must have a dialogue at
the national level hcre in Ottawa in order ta
deal withi national unity and national prob-
iems. When will this government act? When
are they going ta act? We have had the B
and B commission, we have had the Quebac
legislative ccmmittce, we have liad the prov-
inces calling a confederation for tomarrow
,conference, we have had conferences ail over
the country dealing with somcthing with
whichi the federal authority should dca],
national unity and national problems. Why is
there this mandarin suspicion of politicians
on the part of the present governmcnt?
Whethcr you likçe it or nat, whether you
believe you know what is hest for the people,
constitutions and political documents.

You are going ta have ta have the co-aper-
ation of every member of this house in a
dialogue in which every member of the
house cani take part, rether than present us
with a fait accompli. I suggest this is anc of
the things upon which this govcrnmcnt is
going ta have ta act. Canadians ail over the
couintry are sick and tired of the buck pass-
ing bet-wcen Ottawa and thec provinces end
the fact theat na level of governiment is deal-
ing effectively withi meny of thc modern
problems facing aur young nation. 1 repeat
those prohlcms. There is inflation. Ten years
ega thcrc was no douht in the world it was
the federal atithority that hed jurisdîctian
over inflation and the cost of living. But now,
the mninister passes the buck and Canadians
wetch a gavcrnmcnt that refuses ta take the
first step ta modernize the constitution pass
the buck hack ta thic provinces. Na levrl of
government sccms ta be tackling tiiese
probleras.

Thoera is housing. Flan. members opposite
xviii tell me there is a meeting going on down
the hall with the premiers of the provinces.

Mr. Chrétien: Are ycu ageinst thet?

* (3:40 p.m.l

Mr. Graffiey: Holding meetings does nat

take the place of action. The governmcnt is
only now meeting with the provinces and it

should have taken action anc or twa years
ago. No gaveianment is dealing effectively

with a;r, water and sal pollutian, with urban

blight, developm-ent and radevelopment, xvith

highxvay deathis and injuries, with metro

problems and treffic communication. Which

level of government is deeling with theso

modern prcblems effectivcly, Mr. Speaker,

[Mr. Grafftey.l

while hion. members opposite sit on their par-
tisan hands and do flot lot a national palitical
dialogue take place? French and English
speaking Ceandians alike do not care as long
as soe levei of government gots an with the
j ob.

As we modernize aur constitution we shahl
obviously flnd many questions old and ncw
that requiro joint action, which in turn will
require the impravement of consultative
machincry between Ottawa and the prov-
inces. AlIDA and the resources experience in
my view set good precedents in this regard.

Many government supporters point ta ahl

of the faderai-provincial canferences that
have been held. But, Mr. Speaker, these con-
ferences are often held far fao late when the
damage hias been donc, as is the case with
the anc now bcing held in a crisis atmas-
phere. The conference the government is
holding now should have been hcld one or

two years ago. The govcrnmcnt is like a
rudderless ship gaing from crisis ta crisis as
the people hase confidence in it. If the gov-
crnment doos not start estahlishing priarities,
modernizing the constitution and improving
consultative machinery with the provinces,
ihien if I may paraphrase the remerks of my
leader, Canadians xviii continue ta feel that
keep'ng thîs goverrnment in office is far too
high a price ta expect the people ta pay.

[Translation]
Mr. Chrétien: Wouhd the hion. member for

Brome -Missis quoi allaw me just anc ques-
tion? How cen hie say that the government is
holding to Oc mny federal-pravincial conter-
onces and by the same taken suggest that the
faderai governmcnt shaulfi dîscuss priorities
and Canadian unity with provincial govern-
mients? Docs hae ignore complotely the foder-
ai-provincial conference xvhich will ha taking
place in January with regard ta the Bill of

Rights?

Mr. Graffley: Unfortunetely, the minister

lias once again misinterpreted my speech. I

suggcsted nothing of the sort. At last, prab-

lems xvili be discussed with the provinces.

But xvhat I said, and 1 rapeat it, is that a

niational dialogue must ha initîeted here in

Ottawa with aIl political parties.

Thet is nat what I saifi end thc hcn. mem-

ber mnisintcrpreted my speech.

Mr. J. R. Com±ois (Joliette -L'Assompio-
Montcalm): Mr. Speaker, I sincerely wonder

if the hion. members opposite are seriaus

when they move a non-confidence motion
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