
-,.JuI *1 1-1.7 
-

COMMONS DEBATES

NDP voted, defeating it. It bas often been suggested tbat we in
the Conservative Party bave no alternatives, but tbat alterna-
tive would bave provided an incentive for Canadians to own
bornes. We on tbis side feel tbat those expenses sbould be
legîtimate deductions from incarne and tbat tbis was positive
action to address tbe problern. Tbe minister of bousing bas
tbrown a papier macbé life ring to drowning Canadian borne
owners.

1 sbould like to draw to tbe attention of tbe House tbe
minister's remark wben be introduced tbe bill on February 8,
1982, as reported on page 14760 of Hansard. He said:

1 would like to add that these 15,000 new units would mean flot only

affordable homes for 15,000 more familles, but also an estimated 35,000
additional jobs for people involved in the construction industry and associated
businesses.

In tbe past 1 was spokesman for bousing on tbis side. Tbe
bigbest multiplier we could find to wbich experts referred tbat
related bousing starts ta jobs-and 1 cbecked tbis information
tbis afternoon-was 1.75. If 1 take tbe 15,000 bousing starts
and multiply tbern by 1.75, 1 corne up witb 26,250 jobs. 1
suggest tbat eitber tbe minister is guilty of bis usual accuracy
or, if the figures are true, be is guilty of bis usual inaccuracy.

I sbould like now ta deal witb tbe minister's actions as
minister responsible for bousing wben tbe budget was present-
ed and the bill was introduced. Wben we look at tbe attitude of
governiment in regard to tbe bill, we must also look at tbe
attitude of tbe minister to government and to tbe I-buse of
Commons. In the week preceding tbe budget, on November
13, 1981, tbe minîster's officiais were busily calling selected
Canadian borne owners and telling tbern to hoîd on until
Tbursday nigbt, that there wouîd be sometbing in the budget
to help tbem. Tbe criteria for calling was neyer disclosed to tbe
House, altbougb we asked for it. Sorne Canadian borne owners
were called, otbers were not, but everyone had some bope.
Then tbe bill was presented and everyone Iost bope.

Subsequently tbe minister announced to tbe House tbat be
bad personally signed in excess of 10,000 letters directed ta
Canadian borne owners. To tbink of a minister of tbe Crown
sitting down to sign personally 10,000 forrn letters boggIes the
minds of everyone on tbis side of tbe House. Tben the budget
was brougbt down, and everyone Iaugbed wben the minister of
bousing made bis comments. Then after 19 rnonths of monitor-
ing, Bill C-89 was tbe piteous and paltry answer. Lo and
bebold, the next day advertisernents appeared in newspapers
inviting people to contact CMHC about its new plan. We on
tbis side found it passing strange tbat tbe ad bad been placed
s0 quickly on Friday by a minister wbo had advised us on
Tuesday tbat be bad no idea wbat wouîd bappen on Tbursday.
Tben we obtained tbe answer. The officiais bad worked
througb Tbursday nigbt and, as a result of bard work, pro-
duced a carneraready ad in Ottawa wbicb was tben taken ta
Montreal for sbooting and delivered ta newspapers sucb as tbe
Brockvîlie Recorder and Times in tirne to be printed on
Friday. At a later date it was deterrnined tbat tbe ad in fact
was produced on tbe Monday nigbt prior ta tbe budget, tbat is

the Monday nigbt priar to tbe Tuesday wben be told us be bad
no idea wbat would be in tbe budget on Tbursday. Tbere are
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two scbools of tbougbt on tbis side of tbe 1-buse in tbat regard.
One believes tbat tbe minister deliberately rnisled tbe House;
tbe otber believes that tbe minister was misled by bis officiais.
In eitber case tbe minister became tbe laugbingstock of tbe
House, tbe media and tbe country.

1 sbould like now ta turn ta the area of bousing starts.
Under Liberal government housing policies, Canadians are
facing an accommodation crisis. In 1980, we required 222,000
bousing starts ta adequately sbelter Canadians, and Liberal
government policies resulted in 159,000 starts. Tbey improved
in 1981, at wbicb timne we required 222,000 bousing starts ta
adequately sbeîter Canadians, and Liberal government policies
resulted in 178,000. Tbis is governrnent by sbortfall; bousing
policy by shortfall! In 1982, again we required 222,000 hous-
ing starts ta adequately shelter Canadians, and the figures
released this week sbow that we will acbieve 148,000 bousing
starts.
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Tbe bousing start figures indicate tbat batb tbe single
family residential rnarket and the multiple dwelling rentaI
accomodation mnarket are facing seriaus sbortfalls. In fact, tbe
single family residential market bas become completely unat-
tractive because of mortgage interest rates and presenit eca-
nornic difficulties. For tbe sarne reason it is unattractive ta
build rentai accommodation.

During tbe past two years the national vacancy rate for
rentai dwellings bas dropped from an accessible 2.3 per 1,000
units ta an intolerable 1.4 vacancies per 1,000 units. Tbe
Liberal bigb interest rate policy bas played a significant role in
discauraging tbe building of rentai bousing.

One of the devices tbat was still providing some rentaI
accommodation was tbe multiple unit residential building pro-
gram. Tbe Minister of Finance (Mr. MacEacben) eliminated
the MURB prograrn on November 12, 1981. In doing so, tbe
Minister of Finance eliminated projects wbicb were in process
at tbat date. Tbousands of Canadians were thrown out of work
by tbe actions of tbe Minister of Finance.

Witbin a week the Minister of Finance backtracked and
reinstated tbe MURB program, provided the footings or otber
base supports were in place by December 31, 1981, or wbere
arrangements for construction were made in writing and sub-
stantially advanced by Navember 13, 1981 and tbe footings
were in place by May 31, 1982.

I arn nat bere ta debate at lengtb tbe value of MURBs.
Tbere is a scbool of tbougbt tbat says tbey are a legitimate
device ta stimulate the production of rentaI accommodation.
Tbere is a scbool of tbougbt that says tbey are notbing but a
tax dodge for tbe ricb. But, in any event, that device will
disappear on May 31, 1982.

In the House of Commons we bave ta ask ourselves bow tbe
Minister of Finance could bave been sa out of toucb witb
reality to farget about tbe provisions ta pbase in tbis elimina-
tion of MURBs. Wby could tbe minister forget to phase it in
and leave ail of tbose people trying ta provide rentai accommo-
dation out in tbe cold? Tben he backtracked.
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