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this article. The first principle to bear in mind is that coots are
payment for law-yer's services; the. mevis by whieh lie makes
hi& living and that if the practice of law ic to lie decexxtiy and
honourably conducted, it must offer to good men a fair and
lîberal return, For solicitors in England their fees werc never
looked upon as honoraria, they were always the lawyer 's
tiwages" for work donc and soinething to whicli ho was en-
titled by right (sc Germyn y. Roili, Cro. Eliz. 425 to, 459;
Th,,-r8by v. Warren, Cro. Car. 15i), and in our country whoe
the two professions are combined the riglit to recover fees iis
expressly given by statute. No sensitivcnc.s, therefore, on the
subject sueh as was manifested by Erie, O.J., in Kennedy v.
Brown, 13 O.B.N.S. 677, should preclude us fromn cousidering
the payment of focs in their truc liglit, namely, as the lawyer 's
ineans of livelihood, and, when this i% applied to modern condi-
tions and cost of living, we shall at least hav;e a sensible view
point f rom, which to o bserve this important topic.

It ahould next bie pointed out that no0 systeim of fees ean lie
satisfactory that dom. fot consider the varions elements of cost
that enter into the conduet of this as of any other business or
manufactory. A lawyer would make muoli fairr- charges wh -h
lic could more fully justify if te eacn piece of work done lie
could allot approximately the initial coat meu rrcd ini earrying
it ont. The elements of ment, taxes, wages, office ex penses and
intemest on capital are juat as real and just as insistcntly pro.
sent in his business as in any mercantile pursuit, and no lawyci'
can say that his work han cost him nothing, because ho lias paid
no cýsh for govemnment feeu, stamps or other out of pocket dis-
bursements. If it were realized that everything donc lias cost
money aud if the amount of cost could be allotted ini each ceue
(and there is nothing to prevent it) a lawyem would know just
how mucli lie ie giving a client when lic undercharges or dmc
work for nothing, and how mnuch, therefore (and this itq moat
important) hc is overchArging sme one else in order tu bring
hie receipts up to a point that wilI enable him to live. It i. flot
pretended that work mnust not soinetirnes lie dloim for liotling
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