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whîch were attended by the greatest concourse of peopi
ever known ini Charlottetownto accornpany .the remains c
any person to the mansions of the dead. 1 had for soni
years enjoyed the friendship of this gentleman. I was on
of the Iast that parted with him on leaving the Island;, an,
six montlis afterward I saw his body laid in tue gra-v,
When 1 say thaý few men have left the world more regrette
by bis acquaintance, that in his manners hie was truly
gentleman, and that hie possessed in an eminent degree a
the kind and good qualities which gain the hearts and tii
esteem of men, no one who knew him will say that 1 e>,
aggerate. He was boru in Scotland, served His Majeat
for sonie years, was taken on the coast of France an
remained ten years a prisoner in that country." '-McGrego;

"On Tuesday Iast, the Schooner Feronia'arrived bei
from St. Paul's Island having on board the remains
Donald McKay, Esq., and Capt. MeAlpin. The party ser
on the nielancholy expedition report that having reachc
the place of their destination, they dîsembarked at dai
break and found within haîf a mile of the shore, eleve
bodies, those of Messrs McKay and McAlpin includec
Fifteen were yet wanting to complete the dismnal list
sufferers, and for several hiours they carefully explored tl-
desolate rock in hopes of their meteting with thein. The
search, however, was fruitless, neot a trace of themn beli
discoverable. After wrapping up the bodies of Mr. McKa
and Mr. McAlpin in tarred sheets, thiey deposited theni i
coffins, well prepared for the purpose, and then proceedE
to performn the Iast mielancholy office over the rernainin
nine, covering theni wýith earth and sods, which they pri
cured with sonie difficnllty at a considerable distance. I
the absence of information a great latitude is given to coi
jecture, and a variety of opinions bave been broached, as I
the possible lengtb of tine that elapsed froni the landing i


