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he said n .,W he had changed his mind and he would take his
rifle with himn to the swamp1 and run bis chances. lIt would
seemn to be fairly clear that this was riot evidenc,.e, but the fact
of it flot beir.g so i.- a striking conlmentary upon the arti-
ficiality of the rules of evidence as administered by our courts.
Nine hunOreil and ninety-nine out of a thousand would say.
without hesitation, that a statemient of this kind tnade bv
Ernory imrnediately before his murder vrould be strong proot
of Who the murderer wvas.

D)avis died as sto]idly as he had lived; he showed no desire
for life or fear of death. Mrs. Ernory, it is said, haunted the
v'ieinity of the gaol where Davis was conflned un.cil his,
exectition. She afterwards rnarried again.

W. R.RuE..

A contemporarv relates the following incident which is
worth noting nowv that attorneys have passed off the scene
and solicitors have taken their place: When Lord Tenterden
was Chiet justice a gentleman pressing into his Court, which
r.as crowded at the titne, coniplained that he could flot get to
his counsel. Lord Tenterden:- IlWhat are you, sir>' ?vly
Lord, I amx the plaintiff's solicitor. " Lord Tenterden: .We
know nothing about solicitors here, sir. Had you been in the
re.spectal)le rank of an attorney 1 sho 11d have ordered room
to he made fr r vou.»


