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Conra7 <to teir iamthe

intamualut known as the
*Wrecklag Crw' arc c*aators,
building s Iagacy of participation
on campus.&

Th uitwbch bpsnnthe
1 970's, ofiinated from the iuxth
floot of Mackenzi 111in tlae-a.
ideue and empIaethe social
aspect of part4iptms i the M.
tramural pmograms at the.U of A.
SIinc thelf the unithu ape
to include boit male anud f.mai.
friands of te. res-oiineas.

Aogh soclIis is till a
imuportant aspect of dair parti-
cipation, the Wreckiug Crew has
evolved itito a unit experiencing
achieveansat in sports.

The Wreckin Crcw'hasde.-
vloped a reptttioii for a sports-

matike and dpndable approsch
to intrémurais. Whie members
undeauably enjoy the. pasore of
'wiaig Cvets, thay fin4 thit
participation reprdtaasof fiuai
placement is mot gratifying.

STii. unit% Pkftosoplsy l re-
flected by its mcmb.nship which
includes botb bginhr ahhdblgly
skilled individuais. Beglnners art
irdroduoedto sports through Cam-
pus R=auionansd the unit. As

welt, thoe Who ftcel in 4certain
activitis are provid.d wi tiith
opportuuity 10 reia. their ekilis
through participation. Thie unit is
compriseil of âme. hdividuuls

Who ecoel i la em totactivity.
However. excellence dons mot

-om before partIipation, as uit
'mcamber wwq ae skuiýlain onbe
arc& archenapdto participate
in other activities as weit.

The. Wrocking Crew's ap-
proach, with an emph"ai on par--iiain ocotbe oad
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