
THE GOOD NEWS@.

MARY MAGDALENE;
OR,,Tl1S FIR8T APPEAIlANCE 0F TIIE RISEN

In Joseph's garden, and at Josepli's
sepulolire, a wernan is crouehing in grief.
She caine to, weep, but she did not expect
te find au ernpty tomb. ler hieart is
heaving, big -with sorrow, as ber tear-
bedimmed eyes aïe atteinpUng te gaze
into the vacant vault. But as she stoops
te look tbrough the grey morning liglit,
the sighit starties ber, for there in the rock-
hewn tomb she sees twve angels sitting la
soleina contemplation, lier sobs arrest
tlîeir. attention, for a wenan's tears Malt
even the heatrta of ang(els. IlWolnan, wliy
we.epest thou V" is their sympathizing ent-
quiry.. -"lBecause tbey bave taken away
rny Lord, and I knovr net where they bave
laid fim," is ber heart's reply. fiow few
Marys are there in the-werld! Hew few
there are who weep for a lest Saviour!1
Would that tlxere were more, for Lie ever

dr , xih te, sucli sorrewing eues with
sweet words of comfort. And fiere hoe
cornes te, Mary, for the sound of the Ap-
proaching footstep wvhich turns lier atten-
tion round, is that of Jes «us, who bas coe
te surprise bier, and te give ber beauty for
ashes, and the oil of joy for mourning, and

*the garment ef praise for the spirit of
benviness. "ýWoman, wby weepest tbou 2
wvhom seekest thon 2" are bis soothing.
words. She, takingy hlm te, le the gar.

*dener, pleads wvith beqeecbing teîidei'ness.
"Sirif thon hastborne binalience, tell me

where, thon hast laid hland I wilI take
bim awIiy." Jeans listens in silence, and
stands for a moment bebeld.ng; fer lie
loves te look up0ii snch tears as those
'whieh tricled down ber cheelis, Itq- was
te hlma a better èiglit than that of hosts of
angels, witb golden harps ranked up té do
lim Lonour. lie gazes with deliglit, be-
vause in ber lie sees of the travail nf bis
8eul and La satisRed. Then in bis gentie,

weIl known and heavenly accents, lie saye
IlMary."- It is enougli. Theïe wvas more
tban magic in bis veice. That one wrord
briglitens up ber eyos with jey. She
neither asfea for a siglit of the nail-pieed
bands, nor of the spear-tlîrust aide. "4Rab-
boni? P' "Master V' sble e.~lahswlo 812e
casts herseif a worsbipper nt bis feet. That
familiar veice bad, before nôw, sent suit-
beaim of gladness fite ber dîîrk, despa- ir-
ing sou]. Jesus, however, tells lier te, re.-
serve ber' adoration until lie had entered
on bis celestial. glory. lier duty now 18,
Dot te lie a worshipper at hîs feet, but to,
go and tell bis bretlîren that be wvas soon
te, ascend te fis Fatber and their Father,
and te fis God and their God. Mary',
elated witb gladness, quickly bears tbe
thdings te bis discensolate followers-tlre
tidings that Jésus b «ad indeed risen froni
tile dead,aiîd tlîat she had seen and talked
with fim. She lîad gene te the grave
wyeeping ; new she, retiirns rejeicinig; for
that Saviour who, Lad dethroned the idots
of ber beart la a1iv'e again, and1 iý stili the
samne loving ene lie bad ever been t "O0
wlint arn 1,"' she ivould re4son. witlî ber-
self, "Lthat my Lei bath appeared thus
unto me ?" But it was so like Jesus te do.
as Le did then, anîd lie s the saine yestcr-
day, to-day, and for ever. Any 'wbo w'111
ceaie weeping te centemplate a ciucîfied
Savieur iii tbe toinli, even theugli vile),
than Mary Magdalene ever was, shail soon
know of a truth tliat Christ~ is rison indeed,
that tbey are risen Nwith fim, and that
seen, wlieîe hoe now is thero shall they also

be.» X. Y. Z.

SATAN.-If Satan dToth fetter us, 'Lis la-
diffei'ent te him wliether it be l>y a cable,
or a hair; nay, pei'hapa the rnahlest sius are
lus greatest strata«gems.-F-udler.

SELP.-D0 Vou want te k-new the mnan
agai ast wbom 'ou have Most reasen to
guard yourself 2 Youir 1oeking-ghi's Nwil


