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case that the Warden makes attendance a privilege attaching to 
good conduct. We would be glad to open a similar school in the 
jail were the means forthcoming ; and we do trust more means will 
be sent in for our work. The past year we have not had a single 
sum sent in voluntarily, (that is, we have had to ask for every dol­
lar). Surely a work of this kind must commend itself to hundreds 
of people whom our collector never reaches. Please, dear friends, 
think of this work for the sinful and the lost for Jesus sake.

Our spiritual work has been also greatly blessed. The report of 
the Sunday School Superintendents will state this in some de ail. 
Many, many, have been drawn away from an evil life to a happy 
trust in God and their Saviour. But, oh how we need workers. 
We have not half enough teachers to-day. Are there not many 
Christian men and women who have real love for perishing souls, 
and who, reading this report, will offer themselves for the work. 
Only one hour of a Sunday morning. The harvest, truly, is plen­
teous, but the laborers are few. Pray ye, therefore, the Lord of the 
harvest, that He wili send forth laborers into His harvest.

1

Before closing this report we wish thankfully to acknowledge the 
receipt of a valuable donation of school books, etc., from W. J- 
Gage & Co., also tracts and periodicals from Mr. A Sandham, of 
the Y.M.C.A., and supplies of tracts from the Upper Canada Tract 
Society, the Willard Tract Society, and from the Librarian of the 
Metropolitan Church.

S. H. BLAKE, President.
S. E. ROBERTS, Secretary.
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