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Baugli immediately sent IProctor to Toronto. IProctor
endeavoured fo secure an option from Stimson upon the
stock, and 1 have no doubt that Baugli is riglit whieu lie
says that his instructions Vo Proctor were to, secure an op-
tion. H1e liad given IProctor two cheques, one for $5,000
and ojie for $2,500; and Proctor's idea was Vo obtain an op-
tion by putting up the $2,500.

As soon as iProctor interviewed Stimson and Suggested
an option, Stimson declined, and stated that lie would ýonIy
deal on the basis of an unconditional contract. Finally a
letter was dictated by Stimson, addressed to Baughî and
given to Proctor, offering to seli the stock upon certain,
terms. Communication was liad over the felephone between
]?roctor and Baugh. The resuit was a request for a modifi-
cation of terms, and a second letter; then further discus-.
sion, resulting in a letter dictated by Stimson but signed by
Proetor in the name of «ý E. L. ]3augh & Co., per A. P.
Proctor," whieh refers to the two letters signed by Stimson
and accepts the offer. This letter states that a contract wilI
be at once drawn.

Stimson was about fo leave the city, and iProctor con-
sulted his own solicitor, and lad a contract drawn and pre-
sented to Stimson for signature. If turned out that this
contract was only an option, and I cannot acquit Proctor
of fhe hope and desire to have this document signed by
Stimson without Stimson realizing its true nature. The
document is not produced, the solicitor who prepared if hias
unfortunately no copy, and, equally unfortunately, cannot
find the sfenographic notes from which the original was
transcribed. It was, at any rate, contrary to the letters in
question and to the intention of Stimson and IProctor.

Stimpson was about to leave the city, and Proctor con-
once promised fo have the mistake recetified. A new docui-
mnent,that now in question, was drawn by the same solicitor
and ultimately signed. Baugh says that lie gave no authority
either before Procfor's deparfure to Toronto or otherwise to
Proctor to inake an absolufe contract, and that Proctorls
authority was strictly limited to the obfaining of an option.

A tel egram is produced, unsigned, but no doulit freux
Baugh, te Proctor, «Wouldi scuggest you comply wifh Stim-
son's wishes. Feel confident we could succeed in selling
sýufficient f0 pay amount due July at liffeen cents. Find out
Mae's (mea-ningt MeCal!ery's) purchaser if possible."


