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THE ROYAL MEMOIR.*

Since our last issue the literary and gossip-
ing public lias enjoyed a marked sensation. It
was producedI hy tute perisal, oft' The r'
Yeîtrs- of His Royal Fligliness the Prince Con-
sort," which, on this side cf the water, was
neatly issued by Messrs. Hlarper & Brothers.
%vith tlie sign nianual. IIVICTORIA R." on onle
side of the cover, and thec Royal Amnis on the
back of tie book, the siglît of whichi, lîy our
American cousins, is cnougi Il to niake tlieir
teetis water." What; would they not give for
tlîe riglbt to use thcsc time-lîoucrvd lieraldic
devices and tlie inevitable IJoni soi qui mal y
p.ense ? The Memnoir, itself, lias, we dame say,
been read with as nueh zesý,t in the Ujnited
States as in the Bri.ish Isies, the Nýewv Domin-
ion, and the rest of the wor!d. Wlîen it is ne-
cessamy to interest the ordi nary maba of human-
ity in a tale it is safe to begin wvith such words
as IlTiiere wvas once a lovely Pincess," while
Royal readers înay be treated to tales of peas-
ant boys ani girls, even though it bo truc that
"lone touch of nature makes the whole %vorld
kmn." To be partieularly informied as to tlue
manner in which princes aînd princesses enter
tîxis worl. how they cmy and Lugli, eat and
drink, and sleep and play, wliether or tout ttbcy
arc, at times, nauglîty like ordinary plebian
children-howv their loves and courtships are
carried on, etc.. etc.,-suich information as this
ouglit to invest any book %vith intercst; înost
of aIl ougblt it to invest with intercst the book
before us, of which flic Ilon. C. Grey is tlîe
compiler, Il Albert the Good"I* tle subject, and
our most graciotis QuE ESN thc editor, if îlot
ratlier tbe author AmI sucli, in point 'f fact,
ail rentiers who takv up this volume w% Il admit
to be the case. Though it is undemstood that
every miother bQlievets, lin regard to liem fir-t-
born, at lcast, --that tiiere never was sncb a
child." and thoîîgh some fond nmotluers and
fatbers, too, m:îy be ready to affirn tliat if the
biograplîlcal. menioirs of tlîeir of.ipring wcre
carricd as far back as those of PrInce Albert,
to the cr:tdle and beyond it, they coulîl produce
a record tiat wonld compare favoreably witb the
Royal Memioir, y'et no0 person %vho ueads this
volume can deny that Prince Albert, in tlie
cradie. in sebool, and at college. wvas a vt'my

rrkb child. boy and youtli. anid tlutt if lie
only %~îinally got tlogged, it wvas because lie
vety > tdoiii required to be treated to that poâte-
s-ioni mode of '-teaciing the yoting idea, how to
shoot," buit was. altogether, sucli a model and
exemiplar tbat %vhen ire read bis story aînd re-
caîl our oîvî boyk)î1 d;îvs, wc fiuud that the' sad

contrast has the etrvct of suffusing our cheeks
îvitlu spontaneouis bluslies.

After a letter of tlit, comwpiler to the Queen,
and some introductory remarks, the book comn-
miences with a short accouint of the Saxe Co-
burg family, and of the Prince's immiediate re-
latives at the timie of his birtlî, in 1819. Tlie
faînily ivas greatly distinguislied in the great
Reforniation struggles, on belbalf of whiclî one
brancb of it suffered miuch. The mnost interest-
in- of the fainily notices, however, refers to
Prince Albert's mnotber, the Duchess (Princ6-ss
Lrn!ie) datuîliter of Atugustus, last reigning
Duke but one of Saxe-Gotha-A Ienburg.

À xwenorandum, written by the Queen in
186l, gives an account of thieir mnothier and of
lier meianclîoly fate. Shie is dlescmibed as
"4very luandsome, aithougli very smiall, fair,
and with blue cycs; and Prince Albert is said
to have been extremiely like lier." She was,
moreover, full of cleverness and talent. But
tlîe marmiage was flot a hanppy one. Tbe Duke
and Duchess were separated in 1824, and di-
vorced in 1826, and tlîe Ducliess died in 1831,
in lier 32nd year. Slie is alw.-ys spoken of witlî
affection and respect. and we are told that, "the
Prince never ftîrgot lier, and spoke vitlî niuch
tenderness and sorrow of his poor niotlier, and
was decply affectedl in reading, after lis mar-
riage. tlîe accounits of her sad and p:iinful ili-
ness." After lier dcatlî in 1831, l)uke Erniest
soon marricd again; but, of course. under 'liese
ciretinîz>t.nces, nt'itlicr tle nmotlier nor tlîc step-
miotiier of tbe twvo young Princes liad nîuch
control over their education. They experi-
cnccd, however, no lack of motlîerly care; for
tivo zr.inilniotlierstvatclid ovt r dioni froîîî tlueir
car: t ,, , witli the uîîost constant anxiety.
Tlîeîrgaoor on ttte fatthor'b bide, the
Dowager iDuclîess cf Colt,.trg-Saalfel,', lived at
only a quarter of a mnile's distance 'un one side
of Coburg. at a villa callcd Ketschendorff,
while Rosenau, the summer residence cf the
Duke, wvas but four nmiles on the other side.
On tlîe birth of Prince Albert she was suno-
moned at once to the bed sîde of lier dauglîter-
in-law, ani we find lier from tlieme writing to
annouince the happy event to her own datiglter,
tlîe Duchess of Kent. in England.

Why the marriage was nnhappy. or why the
separation took place, in etnacqiuenceo f whizli
the mother neyer saw lier elîildren afterwards,
we are not told Indeed, tlue naine of the un-
happy lady is seldom mentioîn -d afterwards,
thongh., as above stated, alu-ays with respect
and afction. It is mentioned that one of the
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