
but that even the Legislatures of the Colonial
Governiments constit.uted and appointed with
less power and solemnity than tie Legislature
of Upper Canada, have enjoyed and exercised,
and still enjoy and exercise, powers and privi-
lecges of a most extensive and important nature,
fully sutlicient to -ecure their dignity and inde-
pendence.

From all whicb, your Committee, Ivith dc-
ference, are of opinion, that tIe Legislative
Council will asuae no new or arbitrar rule of

proceeding, by maitaining and asserting their
jurisdiction iii ma1tters of prailege and cou-
tempt.

ON MOTION, ma'le and seconded, ORERaH>
that the above report be adopted, and it was

RESOLVED, That, forbearing any notice of
what is passed ; the arresting and impri-
soning during the Session, any Ollicer or
Assistant of this Hlouse, not being charged
criminally, Ir High Treason, F elony, or
breach of the Peace, is a contempt of and
a high breach of the Priv'ileges thereof.

April 2d, 1821.
On Motion, made and seconded, ORDERED.

that Fifty Copies of the fbregoing Resolution
and the Report of the Comnittee of Privileges,
be printed.

JNO. POWELL.
".L. C.


