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ARTICLE L

S oon as the Prelimncaries fhal bc
_k-- fgned and ratified, finec-r friendfhip

fhal be re enablifhed betwveen his Britannic
Majefty and his Moft Chriin Majefty, their
kingdoms, dlates, and fubjls by fea by land,
in all parts of the world. Orders fhall be fent
ro the armies and fquadrons, as well as to the
fubjeàs, of the two powers, to flop all hofni-
lities, and to live in the moif pei fe& union,
foigetting what is paffed, of which their So-
vereigns give them che order and example.
And, for the execution of this article, fea-paffes
ihall be given on each fide for the fhips which
fhall be difpatched to cau-ïy the news of it tO
the potièfflons of the faid powers.

2. His Majefy the King of Great-Britain
lhall preferve in full right the Ifland of New-
foundland, and the adjacent iflands, in the
fame manner as the whole was ceded to him
by the thirteenth Article of the Treaty of
Utrecht, fave the exceptions which fhall be
flip-lated by the fifth Article of the prefent
Treaty.

3. His Moft Chriftian Majefty, in order to
prevent quarrels which have hitherto, arifeai
between the two nations of England and
France, renounces the right of flhing, which
belongs to him by vieue of the faid Article oF
the Treaty of Utrecht, from Cape BonavinacI
to Cape St. John, fituated on the eaftern coaft


