
hold a patent for any surgical instrument or medicine; or to dispense a
secret nostrum, iwhether it be the composition or exclusive property of
himnself or of others. For, if such nostrum be of real efficacy, any con-
cealment regarding it is inconsistent with beneficence and professional
liberality; and if mystery alone give it value and importance, such craft
implies either disgraceful ignorance or fraudulent avarice. It is also
reprehensible for physicians to give certificates attesting the efficacy of
patent or secret medicines, or in any way to promote the use of them.

ART. I.-Pofessiona servces of physicians to each other.

1. Al practitioners of medicine, their wivc, and their children while
'under the paternal cure, are entitled to the gratuitous services of any one
or more of the faculty residing near then, whose assistance may be
desired. A physician affmicted with disease is usally au incompetent
judge of his own case ; and the natural anxiety and solicitude which he
experiences at the sickness of a wife, a child, or any one who, by the tics
of consanguinity, is rendered peculiarly dear to him, tend to obscure his
judgment, and produce timidity and irresolution in lis practice. Under
such circumstances, medical men are peculiarly dependent upon each
other, and kind offices and professional aid should always be cheerfully
and gratuitously afforded. Visits ought not, however, to be obtruded
offciously; as such unasked civiIity may give rise to embarrassment, or
interfere with that choice on which confidence depends. But, if a distant
member of the faculty, whose circumstances are affluent, request atten-
dance, an an honorarium be offered, it should not be declined; for no
pecuniary obligation ought to be imposed, which the party receiving it
would wish not to incur.

ART. III.-Of the duties ofphysicians as respects vicarious offices.

1. The affairs of life, the pursuit of health, and the various accidents
and contingencies to wvhich a medical man is peculiarly exposed, some-
times require him temporarily to withdraw from his duties to his patients,
and to request ,some of his professional brethren te officiate for him.
Compliance with this request is an act of courtesy, which should always
be performed with the utmost consideration for the interest and character
*of the family phisician, and when exercised for a short period, all the
pecuniary obligations for such service should be awarded to him, But
if a member of the profession neglect his business in quest of pleasure
and amusement, he cannot be considered as entitled to the advantages of
the frequent and long-continued exercise of this fraternal courtesy, with-


