
CHURCH SOCIALS AND SOCIAL LIFE.

WVA HY do fot you ministers give sensible speeches atVVchurch socials ? " was the question asked by a lady
friend one day as two of the aforesaid ministers were preparing
to sally forth, to one of these festive occasions. E ver since that
question bas been haunting me; w3t: that I arn prepared to ad-
mit the truth of the implied indictmcntcither in regard ta my-
self or my brother ministcrs. I have attcnded about twventy
Sifice October last, and there is flot one fron -which 1 do flot
carry away some pleasant reminisccnce, some golden thought
fitly framed or somne bright fancy richly clad. 0f the flfty
addresses ta wvhich 1 listcncd I have no remembrance of any-
thing that wvould offend against morality, and litlcl that could
offend ag7ainst gyood taste. The addresses. perbaps, -%vere flot
ail Up to the higli-ivater mark of culture, but they were in the
main suited to the audiences to w'hich they ivere dclivercd, and
ivere infinitely superior in their tone and more attractive in their
matter than the political meetings wvhich xerc held during the
samc time. 'Much as the churchi social hias been dccried and
condemned as an unmitiga-ýted nuisance, I conceive that it lias a
place and spihere af usefulness, and might havc a mucli greater
if bial the timie spent in condcmnation wvas spent in licarty
effort to iniprove it, for until the love of sociability becomes ex-
tinct, and yeung people are born oid, it ivili continue. Christians
cannot afford ta ignore any lcgitimate and wvholcsome nicans of
influencc, nor support anything that is unwvholcsome ; so if it
cari bc shown that this may be a source of good, if it bc mlot so
no-%%, then thicrc is ground flot only for its existence but for its
encouragement. 1 wouid excludc from this papcr cvcrything
that has a purely financial end in vicw1 ithout any highcr or
ultcrior aim, and include cverythiing wvhich has for its object
soial impravrcmcnit.

Thesc: congrega tional gathcrings are flot without thcir uses
to nministers themselh*cs as students af human nature. In our
services 've sec our peoplr. as thcy »,'-ish ta appcar, at our social


