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MT 4A’ DOWNED 8-3
periods of play.

Standouts in this the; ough 
humiliation of the Allison 
bladesmen were Jack D*xver 
and Daryl LeBlanc. Besdes 
scoring three and two goals re­
spectively, they comp’etely 
controlled play when they 
were on the ice almost adding 
humour to the game as one 
watched the f"tile attempts of 
the opposition to contain them.

This performance of the Red 
Devils after three prev'ous 
mediocre efforts at home 
bodes well for the future. They 
showed themselves capable of 
adjusting to a situation that 
would demoralize many other 
teams and came up with a dis­
play of spirit and drive that 
has another MIHL champion­
ship written all through it

defenceman McKinnon, and 
forward Belliveau joined the 
audience.

Coach Kelly, forced by a 
MIHL ruling that the replace­
ment for a goaltender who re­
ceives a game misconduct 
must come from the bench, 
then put Charlie McClvsky 
between the pipes. Since Mc- 
Clusky had very little experi­
ence at this oorition. onlook­
ers waited with bated breath.

Obviously, though, the me 
hers of the Devil team kn 
what they had to do — for the 
remainder of the game, UNB 
fans were treated to a top- 
notch exhibition of extra ef­
fort and defensive skill As the 
final statistics showed, Mt. A. 
was kept down to only thir­
teen shots on MeClusky in tyro-

Saturday evening, January 
16th., was the date for prob­
ably the most bizarre sports 
event ever staged on this cam­
pus.

The UNB Bed Devils easily 
humbled the Mt. Allison ‘rats’ 
by a score of 8-3 but by the 
time the game ended, the 
score was only of incidental 
Interest.

Fans were treated to fisti­
cuffs, player expulsions, in­
juries (faked and real) and the 
fine play of a Devil team on 
the spot.

At the eighteen minute mark 
of the first period, with the 
Devils holding a 3-0 lead, play 
stopped and the fighting be­
gan. The fans roared and 
cheered on the combatant? — 

goaltender Writ:ley,
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The new studios, one of 
which will be about the size 
of the Tartan Room in order 
to contain an audience, will be 
classified either for recording 
or for ‘on the air*.

The station, he added, was 
asked to plan for 20 years a- 
head. The advice of profession­
al stations was solicited by 
Radio UNB, and it is on this 
that these plans are based.

Radio UNB director Ross 
MacLeod announced last week 
that the university station 
plans to acquire $80,000 worth 
of new equipment for their 
proposed new studios in the 
new Student Union Building. 
This figure, he said, includes 
eight new Ampex recorders at 
a cost of $2600 each in addition 
to other technical and office 
equipment. The new statiozv 
headquarters will house five 
studios and three control 
rooms, in addition to office 
and library space.

The reason for the number 
of recorders, MacLeod said, is 
that Radio UNB expects a great 
increase in recording duties. 
He remarked that in the pres­
ent location, there is “no re- 
ebrding space”.______________
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/NEW PROGRAM
“University Highlights" is a 

new half hour Radio program 
Saturdays at 1:30 p.m. on Ra­
dio Station CBZ by Radio 
UNB. To feature the vr-ioua 
aspects of the ‘culture* existing 
at our university is the aim of 
the program. Professors are 
invited to give short talks or 
discussions about their partic­
ular interests — be it poetry 
or politics. Professor WF.M. 
Stewart is faculty advisor for 
the program.

The producer of the pro­
gram, Stephen Hanson, a third 
year Arts student, has three 
years experience with Radio 
UNB. For Radio UNB this is 
the first series produced for 
weekly broadcast by the CBC.

The line up for this Satur­
day at 1:30 p.m. promises to 
be varied and lively: Members 
of the Drama Club will be 
asked to comment on the con- 

“Rashomon”
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Chairman David Tilson; S.R.C. I Ricker-U.N.B. Conference or» 
President Preston Thom; and Oanadlan-Amerocan Relation» 
the Hon. John R. Matheson, [ held at U.N.B. last weekend. 

Co-ordinatinJ | M.P. They were attending the 1

Pictured above from left to 
right are: Dr. Walter J. Muel­
ler, U. S. Consul General in 
Saint John;

UNB-Ricker Meet HereSANTA BARBARA. Calif. 
(UNS) — An editorial in El 
Gaucho, student newspaper of 
the University of California, 
has called for co-ed doimitor-

ada has followed a middle-of- 
the-road policy, whereas the 
U. S. is the world leader of the 
West Ideology.

The delegates spent Satur­
day in informal discussion and 
continuation of the topics; 
raised the previous night.

tions exists. He gave as an ex­
ample our joint defence plans, 
and described the overall situ­
ations between the two coun­
tries as “a rising barometer".

Mr. Matheson, a Liberal in* 
the House of Commons since 
1961, and a Canadian Parlia­
mentary Observer at the six­
teenth session of the U. N., 
stated that both Pearson and 
Johnson were top-level exper­
ienced parliamentarians who 
could meet on common ground 
because of their common back­
ground. He felt that the 
strongest point the two coun­
tries have is the democratic 
theory.

Both men asserted that the 
basic objectives of Canada and 
the United States were iden­
tical, although the tactics use t 
in reaching these objectives: 
were at times different. Can-

Fourteen student delegates 
and three professors from 
Ricker College, Houlton, Me., 
arrived last weekend for a 
two-day Conference on Cana­
ri ian-U. S. relations. On Fri­
day night they, and our UNB 
-delegates attended a public 
address at 8:00 p.m. in Mc­
Connell Hall by Walter J. 
Mueller, U. S. Consul General 
in Saint John, and John R. 
Matheson, M.P., chairman of 
the Standing Committee on 
External Affairs.

Mr. Mueller, a Cornell grad­
uate, who has served since 
1945 with the State Depart­
ment in Frankfurt, Berlin and 
Bonn, told the group that al­
though the difficulties between 
the U. S. and Canada had 
been much-emphasized in re­
cent times, a long history of 
salutations through negotia­

te*.
Opponents on campus say 

students don’t entertain in 
their bedrooms at home so 
they shouldn't be allowed to 
at university.

But the editorial countered 
that the university doesn’t 
provide a living room adjacent 
to the bedroom for such enter­
taining.

“The barbarities of separat­
ing the sexes are far greater 
than

tnoversial play 
■they will be staging soon, 
there will be a discussion with, 
the “Litle Theatre Group” and 
Mr. Bobak will review the 
Fred Ross exhibition now at 
the Arts Center.

MarriageV LATE
FLASHjj___
1ST V - P
NOMINATIONS
REOPENED

VANCOUVER (CUP) — A 
Lutheran pastor told a student 
audience at the University of 
British Columbia Inst we;-k 
that he can see nothing wrong1 
with marriage between two 
men or two women.

L.G. Thelln said he approves 
of marriage between two 
homosexual? if it develops 
greater humaness. Homosexu- 

Con. on page 5

those of integrating 
them,” the editorial said.

“Anyone who has been un­
der a military form of life, or 
in a residence hall, knows the 
crude language that is invited 
by this unnatural situation.

"Providing for the realiza­
tion that the opposite sex is s 
form of human life, can have 
ideas, and make intelligent 
conversation is not evil.”
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