
tAnce, p Gokldn I3eer

of why tighters sboulct retirebefore thcy get old... férmnerly a
great three-time worlds champ-
ion, nôw a washed--up buin:
Roberto Duran... Duran.' Al
true, except that Duran lobked
in great shape. 1His chest was
bigger around than bis waist
for the first lime thiR decade -
couki he be readyi?

'And in the red corner, the
'diampeen. welghed ini at

1.59 and thr*-,duarters nounds
byMAuSumil .

Alberta did it but they did it
the bard way.

58511Ia repap
unal
but
Witt

iiarkley.7-, .
.This really iooked to be one

of the worst mismatches ini
recent years, bu Duran changed
the scenario ca*dy. Showinj
deterinination and defence
ýwhich he seemed to have Iot
years, before, Duran canne
~through with a chassic pprfor-
,rnance. H1e got stronger in the
labo rounds, winning et, lesat
tlwee ef the Iast fout, andllbô-
ing the(younger, biger, strong-
er) champion in the penultiàite
frame.

Still, it went b the judges,
who could have easily given
Barkley extra credit for being.
busy. or who could have failetl
to note that Duran w#5 sippiag-
most of what The Blade W'as,
th towing, and given the çall 10.

J112 garneses.
Bloti Alberta and Calgary, who

finshed in second, had to play
Manitoba and Re~gina in their
final two seriei. While Alberta
only inanaged a split at home to
the lowly Regina Cougars, Cal-
gary was swept at home by the
Manitoba Disons, That lftI the
Bears in first place with only two
games Yemaiping.
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