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BUSINESS GUIDE: 

MOVING INTO MEXICO 

The firm must also develop confidence that'it knows the true intentions of the 
partner. How will the proposed venture fit into the partner's long-term strategy? 
Do they need the venture to fulfill their own tactical and strategic objectives? The 
prospective partners should share the same time horizons and expectations with 
respect to pay-back period. Knowing what the prospective partner needs from a 
relationship, the firm can gauge whether it has sufficient bargaining leverage to 
secure what it wants from the relationship. 

Companies also need to know how to protect themselves in partnering 
arrangements. The firm should use the services of a top-notch lawyer who can 
brief managers on the laws dealing with the protection of intellectual property. 
These rights should be protected against unfair appropriation. 

If an acceptable candidate is not found, the firm should reconsider alternatives 
such as licensing, short-term contracts, mergers, acquisitions, or a greenfield 
investment. It should not feel pressured into a decision. Better a delay or change 
of course than to undertake a serious venture with an inappropriate partner. 

NEGOTIATING A PARTNERSHIP 

Negotiations between prospective partners are the heart of the partnering 
process. They will set the tone and create the structure of the relationship. 
Communications should be honest and frank. Cooperation depends on an 
atmosphere of mutual respect and trust. Trust, however, does not mean ignoring 
difficult questions or brushing aside serious reservations. Trust allows partners to 
meet challenges and solve problems together. Nor does trust mean ignoring 
questions of corporate security. Frank and clear definitions of intent, of the scope 
of cooperation, and of the terms of confidentiality are important. Clarity builds 
trust. The avoidance of important and legitimate concerns can only lead to 
confusion, unease and suspicion. 

THE STAGES OF NEGOTIATION 

In any type of strategic alliance, there are three key mechanisms that mark the 
progress of negotiations. 

1. A business framework is an agreement which clearly defines the objectives of 
the partnership and the form it should take to meet those objectives. 

Z. Once parties have agreed to the terms of the framework, a Memorandum of 
Understanding (MOU) is drawn up to outline the points of agreement in a clear, 
concise fashion. The MOU is then used as the basis for the more detailed and 
formal negotiations of the legal framework. 


