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in that he, along with the government whip, enjoys sorne
special advantages.

e (4:30 p.m.)

Mr. Bell: Explain.

Mr. McCleave. Monetary advantages. I think those
advantages should be given to others. The House leaders
f or the officiai opposition, for the New Dernocratic Party
and for the Créditistes performn special functions in tis
House, and I think they should be given special rewards.
Otherwise, when they corne up against that formidable
feilow, the President of the Privy Counil, they wiil find
that he outpecks thern by $10,000 a year. In the scherne
of tings rnoney means sorneting in the operation of
Parliarnent and the status of people. So Sir, I submit that
we need to take a fresh look at tis. Assurning that the
motion of the hon. rnernber for Winnipeg North Centre is
Parliarnent and the status of people. So, Sir, I subrnit that
the Prime Minister will not run hog wild with tis power
and that he wiil use it with discretion.

'-Mr. Knowles (Winnipeg North Centre): I just asked for
a vote against the clause.

Mr. McCleave: I beg your pardon. I amn advised that iA
is sirnply a rnatter of voting against the clause. I assume
that the hon. member's suggestion wiil be defeated. I
hope that the Prime Minister will exercise discretion and
not go right to the lirnit in appointing the numbers that
he is entitled to appoint. I hope, when the next reorgam-
zation bill cornes around, and they seern to corne around
about every two years and more often than Haley's
cornet, that the governrnent will consider sorne of the
appointrnents in the areas I have suggested.

Mr. Baldwin: Mr. Chairman, may I make a few coxn-
ments and give a little advice. I know advice is sorne-
thing the governrnent does not like getting and does not
take. I see ministers sitting on the government side of the
House to whom I have given advice. If they had taken
it, the advice would have had beneficial effects for both
the ministry and the country. My flrst piece of advice is
this. In bringing about these interesting rearrangernents
and proposais which the President of the Treasury Board
has in mind, I point out that the governrnent has a
lirnited arnount of tirne in which to engage in that
experirnent. They should make the most of that time. An
interesting event will probably take place next year
wich wiil terrninate the capacity of the governrnent for
rnaking appointrnents of any klnd.

Mr. ICnowles (Winnipeg North Centre): Hear, hear!

An hon. Member: That is wishful thinking and not; a
prophesy.

Mr. Baldwin: I suggest to the President of the Treasury
Board that he appoint as rnany members as possible to
those positions. We recognize that rnost backbenchers on
the government side of the House have not been useful to
Pariament as backbenchers. It rnay be that the extra
knowledge they will gain frorn being parliamentary
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secretaries or ministers of state wiil permit them, when
they corne to this side of the House, to play a rnuch more
effective and efficient part than they play at present.

My second piece of advice is this: The government
should try to appoint to those positions backbenchers
who are independent mlnded. I know it is exceedmngly
difficuit for the governrnent to fInd backbenchers who are
truly independent.

An hon. Member: There are a few.

Mr. Baldwin: There are a few who voiced their views
at one tirne but, like good littie Liberal lambs, they went
bleating back to the fold. They have not; been independ-
ent for very long. It is essential for backbenchers to be
mndependent. If there is anything this government needs,
it is a fair amount of independence on the part of its
backbenchers as well as in the executive. It needs inde-
pendence among cabinet ministers; and parliamentary
secretaries.

I see ministers sitting opposite me who have expressed
individual and distinct opinions. They did not do that
because they were independent minded but because they
did not know what the others in the cabinet were doing.
They were confused, as the Leader of the Opposition has
suggested. So, I suggest to the President of the Treasury
Board, to the President of the Privy Counil and to the
Prime Minister, that they should search diligently and
see if they cannot find members arnong the backbenchers
on the government side who are independent and who
will retain that independence. I arn sure that that would
make for better government. There is lots of roorn for
improvernent. I off er this advice and criticism in the hope
that it wiil be accepted.

Mr. Bell: Mr. Chairman, I wonder if I might ask a
question and do a littie reminiscing. I wonder if the
minister could verify tis story. When the present gov-
ernment leader in the Senate was a parliarnentary secre-
tary, he put out so many staternents and did so rnuch
work that he cornpletely overshadowed his minister and
ernbarrassed the governrnent of the day. When they dis-
covered that it would be difficult to rernove hirn, they
decided that the best thing to do was to appoint hirn to
the cabinet.

The Deputy Chairman: Is the cornmittee ready for the
question?

Some hon. Members: Question.
Clause 25 agreed to: Yeas, 35: nays, 21.

On clause 28

Mr. lCnowles (Winnipeg North Centre): M&. Chairman,
before clause 28 carrnes rnay I ask the President of the
Treasury Board why, in the construction of tis bill, one
amendrnent to the Salaries Act is that which is before us
in clause 28, whereas there is another arnendment to the
Salaries Act in Schedule B, page 18 of the bill. Why
could not ail amendments to the Salaries Act have been
put in one place?
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