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doubt that every Notary is possessed of certain expériences that,
could they be reduced to writing would be invaliiable, and that
many, if not ail our confrères, could give explanalions of certain
articles that would be unanimously accepted though possibly not
generally now understood I fear however that the majority of our
confrères in this Province are unprepared to furnish the material
you suggest or to subscribe to the publication.
Then again should you be successful in obtaining the consent of

the Notariés at large you will hâve gathered together an amount
of information that would constitute a more than herculean task to
edit. The work if placed before you would appear to me to require
the undivided attention of a considérable number of confrères.
But while I see thèse very grave difficulties I recognize the fact that
we Notariés are wanting in esprit de corps and that co-operation in
such a work as you hâve so well out lined will not only, if carried
to a successful issue, be invaluable to the profession but will also
serve to create and perpetuate am us that loyalty to our pro-
fession which cannot but elevate to a position far higher thpn that
we now occupy, a position which I think the honorable profession
we follow, its importance and its value to our country deserve.

VVishing you every success and with ma ly thanks for your kind-
ness m submitting the project to me and with the assurance of my
coopération so far as I possibly can.

Believe me to remain

Your's very sincerely

C. CUSHING.


