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To Bishop Hug7i€9. g^

LETTER X.

My Dear F«,enbs .-But a few years since a
Christian mmister in India, in the pursuit of the
objects of his holy mission, met with a Hindoo
devotee A noonday sun was pouring its burn.
i"g rays fioTi a burning sky, upon the burning
sands on which the meeting took place. From.
Its heat the devotee had no proiec tion save the
piece of clotl which hung around his k.fns Hewore a pair of sandals pierced with iron nails
which, at every step, pen<?trated the muscles and
nerves which are so wonderfully collected and
interwoven in the soles of the feet. His sandals
were fi.led with his blood, which marked ins
every feotstep. He was an object frightful to
behold^his body was blistered by the sun, his
hair clotted with fihh hanging around his head
his feet swollen, bleeding and painful, almost re'
fusing to move. The missionary asked him why
he wore those sandals, and why he subjected
himself to such intense suffering ? He replied
that he had committed great sins which were'
grea^'y offensive to the gods, and that in ordeF r
Xf> secure the forgiveness of those sins he wor« ^^
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