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the investirent of the money in the ground rents wvas, under the
circumstances, unauthorized, and a teclinicai breach of trust, and
that there was consequentiy a right ta re-seil the ]and for the
purpose of repiacing the furid, and that as the purchaser had
purchased even with notice of the trust character of the property,
he was nevertheiess protected, as the purchase money reached the
hand of the persan entitledi ta receive it, and he wvas noit accounit-
able for his subsequent miisapplication af it,

WATEROOURSE-ARTIFIIAL CHANNEL-TEMPORARY PL'RPOSL.

In B'urrozrs v. Lan.g (1901) 2 Ch. 502, the plaintiff ciaimed to
restrain the defendant fram interfering with his enjoyinent of a
watercourse in wvhich he ciaimled an casernent. The facts were
that the owner af two adjoining properties, on one of ivhich was a
miii, and on the other a farm, had diverted a stream so as ta form
a pond on, and for the purposes of, the miii property, and the cattie
on the farm wvere usuaiiy watcred at this pond. He soid the farm
property to the plaintiff in î886, %vithout any reference to any right
in the pond, and the mili propèrty ta the defendant in 1893, %vithout
any exception or rcservation. The defendant put a fence fencing off
the pond, which %vas aitogether on his land, so as ta prevent the
access of the plaintiffs cattie thereto, and had cut off the water at
the intake. The plaintiff claimned that under his conveyance ail
xvatercourses passed, inciuding the easement of user of the pond in
question, but Farwveil, J., heid that the diverting of the stream was
for a l'temporary " purpose anily, viz., the user of the miii, and that
under the plaintiff's deed no right liad been conveyed in the miii
pond, or any casernent therein, and consequently the action faiied.

OOMPANY -NANME OF CO.NPANY -t FHàJ - TRALnS NAmE-FoitEnoN FIRM -

INJt'NCTION.

La Société< Anonyme, etc., v. Panhtard L. M. Co. (1901) 2 Ch.
513, was an action by a foreign firrn, which had no agency in
Engiand, but whose g5ads were in fact frequentiy imported into
Engiand, ta restrain the defendant company from using as its
trade naine a frauduient imitation of the name of the plaintiff
campany. Farweil, J., held that the frauduient purpose of the
defendants was established, and that the plaintifes werç entitled ta
an injunction bath as agairst the defendant company, and the
defendants who had signed the memorandum of association, and
who were restrained from aiiowing the defendant company to
remain registered under the name in question.
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