
The'deféntfing Canada- West
Chaàmpon Golden Bear hoc<key
temopened their regular seéasoti

in Lthbrdge n Frdaynight. fril-
day the l3th to be precise, and for
the Pronghomrs the. Gears have
been as bad an omen as the terrify-
ing figure Jason in the Friday the
13th movies.

Last seasn, the Bears pummelIed
the 'I-lons 14-5, 14-2, 11-1, and 10-
2. The 'Horns were sobad last year.
that the local media would bet on,
how many goals the team would
give up... per period.
* This season though, marks a new
beglnning fer botbh the 'Horns and
the Beais. You know the story ber.
as the legend Clare Drake (who
wiII soon have Varslty Arena named

*after him) retirèd, to end an era,
and subsequently long time --assis-
ant Bily Moores took over as head
coach, in so hoping to continue the
glorlous Golden Bear Hockey tradi-
tion. The 'Horns have made a
coachîng change as well. Gone is
Dave Mc Dowai, who coacbed-the
teami to a 25-110-1 record, and in as
new coach is Dave Adolph.

After a scoreles f irst period it
was apparent that Lethbridge bad
made progress with their hockey
program.. Despité being outshot
15-4, the 'Horns showed rmuch
more discipline than last season,
taking nostupidpenaiesand limit-
ing lBear scoring opportunities to a
minimum.

The Bears opened the scoring at
the :30 mark of the second period
as Brett Cox, playing on the Bears
number one"offensive une with
Doug McCarthy and Adam Marri-

-Yeflowaga was* in the sin luln at
4:07 wben Bear captainH Iowie
Draper's slapshot froni the point
found its way thîough a maze of
players, and the Bears were up 2-1.

Witb Dan. Welbe in the penalty
box, for the second Urne in the
period, the'Horns tied the score at
two as Yellowaga t.ok a great pass
from Scott Orban and beat KrillI
with on ly twelve seconds left in the
pe.riod.

One wôuld tbink with the 'Horns
lat goal that they would bave mo-
meftum going irito the third peri-
od, ut, it was the Bearswho would,
dominate. First, Dave Hinglèyi car-
ried the puck over the lHomsblûe-
Une and dropped a pass ta Morri-
son and h. hamnmered a 50 foot
slapsbot paýt fischer.

Cox theri made it 4-2 with his
second goal of the game. The Bear
p owerplay camne through next; as
'Horns -captain, Rod- Philpot, was in
the-box after a questionable calE.-
and newcomer Garth Premak, 1969
Re& Deer College Athiete of the
Vear, took a,,slapsbot from the
point and McCarihy was Johnniy on
the spot for the rebounid te put the
Bears up 5-2 wth nine minutes Ieft
ta play. The Bears then salted away
the victory as AI Tarasuk showed
size and spe-ed breaklng betwveen
'the't-oins Colin Baustad'andMike

nom forwatu MW
buted the differe
year's t.am and
change in atituc

of.' -Dyck reilerated Jaobson>
point. 'People sort of ltugh at
Prongborns hockey_ . hen 1 carne
bere from the. Pats (Regina of-the,
Wegtern Hockey League) 1 knew.
the story, this bas been a junior
hockey town wlth the Broncos and
the 'Canes (Lethbrdge Hurricanes).
What we want to do is develop a
tradition, lik the U> of A."

Sam Facts:,Cox had two goals
and an assist. Monihoo a goal and
tbree àsiss. MicC»thy an Draper
a goal and-assist each. Prmuù ad
a striwg gaine paired i wth Grant
couture. Rookié fowards gitan
Gerai tsand SMm Marple sadi saw
action, Marpie effective wlth bisbody and Gerrits sbowing play-
maklng abllity. Last year's playoff
hero against Calgary, ToMd GoWmè
Icet bis .balance in the warmup and
crashed heavlly into tbe boards,
appearing to hurt bis wîist, but
played anyway.-
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