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he- reolütely 'fiipported the propriety ofr ther
againnhe -outrageous cavils of the governor, téll-

ing hirn that my method would bear demonftration,
and he would take upon hirnfelf to anfwer for the
event. Thus I hoped I fhould be enabled to keep
that part of the parapet which we were to be em:
ployed upon that feafon, out ofthe power of ignor-
ance and precipitation. When the froff became fo
fevere that ve could no longer lay any mortar, I
employed myfeif in making coin§ for the embraf-
fures, but without offering to confuilt the opinion of
the governor about them, who I was certain would

not fail to be on the contrary fide: and finding by
this, that the authority of his office would avail

him but littie againû fuch united oppofition, before
Chriftrnas he eftranged himfelf frorn four of the

mets, the furgeon, the mafter of thë floop, the

titular engineer, and myfeif. The engineer, how-
ever, bcgiring to redt that he had hithértop
facrificed his intefeif to his conpaifance, and that
nothing was to be produced by fiding with 'us but
the Chdpleafure and ill offices of the governor, left
-us very foon, and lived by himfëlf for feveral
weeks, waiting, as we could ealii'y perceive, to be
reqfored to favour. He fuceeded at a by dif
avowing all ou r proceedings ; -and the governor
finding his party ffrengthened, ordered all:the coins
I had made before winter to be altered to his own
method : in confequence of which; the following
fpring was loft to thë building, and the parapet
was entirelv fpoiled.

WHgEN I came to England I follicited a long
time for an opportunity of laying a true ifate of
this· faitar before the Company at ngth they
fent - for me fron Protfmouth by the following
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