
Referrals of Matters from Judicial 
or Administrative Proceedings 

1. In the event an issue of interpretation of the Agreement arises in any 
domestic judicial or administrative proceeding of a Party which either Party 
considers would merit intervention by a Party, or if a court or administrative 
body solicits the views of either or both Parties, the Parties shall endeavor to 
arrive at an agreed position on the proper interpretation of the applicable 
provisions, if any, of the Agreement. 

2. The Party in whose territory the court or administrative body is 
located shall submit any agreed interpretation to the court or administrative 
body in accordance with the rules of that forum. If the Parties are unable to 
reach agreement on the proper interpretation of the provision of the 
Agreement at issue, either Party may submit its own views to the court or 
administrative body in accordance with the rules of that forum. 

Other Measures 

The Parties have agreed to cooperate in the Uruguay Round of multilateral 
trade negotiations and in other international fora to improve protection of 
intellectual property. 

Canada has agreed to revise its copyright law to provide protection to the 
retransmission of copying programming effective no later than the entry into 
force of this Agreement. 

Canada has agreed to phase out discriminatory postal rates for magazines of 
significant circulation. 

The Parties have agreed that on or about March 15, 1988, the Canada 
Mortgage and Housing Corporation (CHMC) shall issue its evaluation of 
American Plywood Association (APA) trademarked C-D grade plywood 
with exterior glue as described in U.S. Product Standard PS-1 for 
Construction and Industrial Plywood for use in housing financed by CMHC. 
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