
Steel of CanadaRAILS FEATURE 
OF WALL STREET; 

C.P.R. IS DOWN

New Riordon Broke 
Led The Market; Sharply On Unlisted 

Market Last WeekPrice Remained Firm at 49— 
Dom. Steel Fell Half a Point 

in Poor Trade.

I

Breweries Struck a Slump, 
Falling, Five Points—BondDeclined Five and a Half 

Points on Very Large 
Offerings.

MEXICAN PETROLEUM 

RALLIES SLIGHTLY

Montreal. June IS—One or two Is ! Market Somewhat Easier, 
sues supplied the bulk of the turn 
over ami the remainder of the Hat! 
was more or less neglected in trad ! 
ing on the local stock exchange tint- Common broke sharply this week, sell- 
urday The largest turnover was in ' aDl^ closing 1 1-2 bid, offered
Steel of t'anada, where there was at a* **■ he Preferred sold down from 
least as THuch buying as selling wsthi"^* ** an<* closed offered at 17, 
the price unchanged at 4$ at the no ^or‘b American Pulp was dull 
close; Dominion Steel was almost enar®u^ last week 8 figures-—3 1-2 to 4, 
lirely neglected only one board lot ' fnd ,Dr.£‘len waa °nchanKed at 14 1-Î 
changing hands at a net loss of 1-2 to,1^ Mattaeanti Common lost half a 
poin, I point, and is now offered at 17 1-2 with

Atlantic Sugar, also active^ppened ! ™ 'b?d !" and the Prefei"
sirong at ?7 aaid moved up to 28, but ed S unchanged, 
cased at the close to 26%, a net loss 
of a small traction. Breweries also 
With a fair turnover scored a net gain! 
of 1-2 point at ûl. Abitibi was steady 1 
at 31 1-2 aad Riordon held its ground 
on a turnover of 228 shares.

Only one issue made a substantia! 
ly large decline, this being Tuckett's 
tobacco, down four points at 36. Do 
minion Bridge was off a point to 67 
and other losses In the general list 
were fractional. In the bank group.
In ion was dpwji two points to 149.

Total sales listed. ::,424; bonds,
$123,100.

Montreal, Jane 19.—-New Riordon

Baldwin and Int. Harvester 
Under Heavy Pressure and 
So Go Lower. Whalen Common 

lost half a point, and Is now offered 
;al 9 1-8, says Balfour, White a"nd Com
panyNew York. Jnne 18 -Selling of rails 

of high and low degree featured to
day's brief but active stock market 
Canadian Pacific was weakest, with a 
net loss of 5 1-2 points on unusually 
large offerings Other transcontinen
tal^ Orangers and coalers were car 
ried down by the movement, as well 
a# some Eastern trunk lines New 
Haven, however, recovered part of its 
extreme decline.

Leaders of the recent reaction hi 
the industrial and special divisions 
were relatively steady. Mexican Pe 
troleunx rallied moderately on addi
tional reports from Washington con 
cerning oil production in Mexico

Under Heavy Pressure.

Breweries Down.

Cuban-Oanadlan Sugar Preferred 
sold at 14. and is now offered at 14 1-2 
with no bid in the Market, and the 
Common sold at 4, and is now offered 
there—a' loss of a point tor the week. 
Laurentide Power was easier around 
67 to 69. and Canadian Car Notes again 
changed hands at 77 1-2. Argonaut 
Gold is offered at 35 cents with no 
buyers in the Market, and Cosgrave 
Breweries is 10 bid. offered at 11. 
Frontenac Breweries lost 5 points sell
ing down from 65 to 60, and closed of
fered at 60 with no bid. Loews Met
ropolitan Common advanced half a 
point to 4 1-2 bid, and Loews Ottawa 
Common lost a quarter of a point, sell
ing at 3 3-4. Winnipeg electric Pre
ferred is offered at 76 with no bid, 
and Western Grocers Preferred soid 
at 63, closing 62 1-2 bid. none offered. 
Ames Holden Tire Common lost half 
a point at 20, and Famous Players 
Preferred lost 3 points selling at 77, 
and closing offered at 80 no bid.
Lake Preferred and Common remained 
unchanged, and Canadian Westing- 
house Common declined from 106 to 
104. and sold at the latter figure, clos
ing 103 to 106. Holllnger was weak
er, selling down to $7.00, and closing 
$7.00 to $7.14. Cockshutt Plow Pre
ferred remains unchanged Imperial 
Oi! is quoted 97 1-2 to 100 1-2, and 
sold at pa r National Brick Common, 
which has been inactive for some time 
is now 6 hid offered at 10.

Montreal Sales
• McDougall g- ( owanj;

BidBaldwin Locomotive, H&rveeter ami 
affiliated shares were under pressure 
and United States Steel reacted to 
within striking distance of its recent 
low. Sumatra tobacco and Cocoa Cola 
were weakest of the miscellaneous 
stocks, losing 3 3-4 and 4 points, re 
spectively. Losses of fractions to a! 
most points ruled elsewhere at the 
heavy close Sales amounted to 
386.000 shares

An increase of about $115,500,000 in 
actual loans and discounts, the first 
heavy expansion in that item for sev
eral weeks, was the noteworthy fea 
ture of the weekly clearing house

Dealings in bonds were of the usual 
week-end character. Liberty issues 
and Victory notes showed only nomi
nal changes, but speculative rails and 
tome foreign flotations were lower 
Total sales, par value, aggregated 
$5,450.000.

Asked
31%Abitibi .........ül'b

Brazilian L H and P . 27 % 
Brompton 
Canada Cement

28
... ;;o

Canada Cement Pfd... 87
Canada Cotton ........  To,
Detroit United ............. 72
Dqm. fanners
D un 1 ron t om............... 24 %
D0111 Tex Com................. 128
Laiventide Paper Co.. S3 
MacDonald Com 
Mt L H and Power... 82
Og I ivies ...................................
Pm 1 man's Limited .............
Wuebec Railway .............. 25
Riordon

50%

74

BlackV.' 30
36

88%
16

100
36%

... 9% 10
SJiqw \\r and P.Co...............
Spanish, River Com... *;;;% 
Spanish, River Pfd...
Steel t o Can Com. .
Toronto Rails ................ 7;;
Wayagamack ....

105
64
71%

Bond Market Easier.
76

Montreal City & District Bank sold 
at 167. and closed 165 to 168; Ster- 

Morning liDe Bank, which was offered at 112
sieamships Com—100 at 20 with no bid'in the Market, if now }09
Steamships Pfd- 2 at 47%. bid 81 offered at 112. Home Bqnk
BruYLliun 12-5 at 27% ' remains unchanged 95 to 98, and pro-
(Vn t eni Pfd — 50 at 87 vincial 133 1-2 bid oiiered at 124.
Van Om Com—2; at u0\ a, in 'rde Unlisted Bond Market bars been 

V 1 IK) at Ù04 rather easier this week, although there
Steel Canada Com-251 at 4" ton *i \ ««ntlmied strong demand ... 

it 1S\. v(t at IS1*, 125 at 4SU !,horJ boI,ds Payable in New
Don Iron Pfd—4 at 51 1 , k The c*’r'er:tl weakness in the
Montreal Power—122 ai S" , eW York Bond Mar*et noticeably af-
Abitibi —"00 at ’’l't fected such issues as Government of
Can Car Pfd—',0 at o Newfoundland 6 1-2‘s 1936 which
Toronto Ry-1 at 74 fat 7-U ?UOled 92 t0 93~a °r two off
laakc of Woods 12 i jo. 2 fr°m lhe reC6Dt iSSQe Pr,Ce' Th« 

Smelting—16 at 15, 10 at 14%.
Fliordon-:> at 8. 5 at 8%. 4f»“at 10 
Wayagamack—75 at 66%.
Atlantic Sugar Com—90 at 27. 90 at 

27%. 100 at 27%.
Breweries

06%

N. Y. Quotations
McDougall A Cowan*» 

t>pen High lxiw
Am Beet Sug. 2S 
Am Car Fdy. 117% 117% 
Am Loco . 77% 70%
Am Smelting. 37% 37%
Anaconda ... >7% 3i % 
Am Tele ...105 105%
Am Can .26% 26%
Am Woollen . 71 1 » • 1 1 *
Beth Steel . .48% 48%
Balt and O C 37% 
Baldwin Loco 68% 68%
Ches and O . 51 51
Cmciblu Steel o4 
Can Pacific .110% lio% 
Cent Leath .. 34% 34 -a
Chandler .... 53% 59% 
Erie Com ... 12% 12V*
Gen Motors .. 9% ....
Gt North Pfd. 63% 63%
Inter Paper . . 53 53%
Mex Petrol ,.10t !V8%
NY NH and H 15% 15%
N Y Central . 67 
North Pacific. 68% 68%
Penns) lvania. 3.1% 33%
Reading Com. 67 6/
Republic Steel 46% 48%
St Paul ........... 25%
South Pacific. 72% 72%
Studehakt-r .. 74’* 
Stromberg 28%
Un Pac Com. 115 115
U S Stl Com. 74 
U S Rub Com 57 
Willys Ovl’d . 7%
West Electric 43% 42%

lU-% 
75% 
35 % 
.1-6-4

tor

105
26%
69%
48

67%
48%
55%

1Ü7
3-4%
58%
11%

57

5 4%
Com — 250 at 51, 25 at53% 51%

12 Span River Pfd—25 at 71%, 50 at 71 
Tucketts—100 at 35.
Dum Bridge—45 at 67.63%

-2%
107% Moncton N.B.TORONTO14

lorouto. June 1»—Manitoba 
I, ,"K No I Northern, 1.84; No. 2. 1.83 • No!

3. 1.76%; No 4. wheat, 1.6?u 
65"B Manitoba oats. No. 2. r.w" 47%; 
45% No. v.w . 43%; extra No. 1 feecL 

No 1 feed 41%; No. 2 feed. 40-

65%

33

6%%71
1 4 % Manitoba barley. No. 2,

28 No. 4 c.w..
114% 69%
74% William.
56% American corn. No. 2 
.... c. i f. bay ports.
4 1% Canadian corn feed, nominal 

Barley. Ontario malting. 65 
outside

Ontario wheat. No. 2. 1.50 
fob shipping points, 
freight

No 2 spring. 1.40 eo 1.45; No. 3 
goose wheat, nominal 

Ontario oats. No. 2, white.
42^ to 44, according to freight

0 w , 79%; 
76%: rejected. 69%; feed, 

All the above in stort Fort Bonds
Due May 1941. 
Price 981-2 and 

interest.
Yielding about 6.15 

per cent.

7 4%
yellow. 76.

43%
to 70,

MONTREAL PRODUCE to 1,60.
according toMontreal. June 1.9—Oats. Canadian 

Western. No 2. tide, to 61c.; No. 3, 55c
to 56c

Flour. Manitoba spring wheat, pat
ents; firsts. $10.60.

Ml 11 feed—Holied oats, bag 90 Ibe.. 
$3.05; bran. $25.2-5; aborts. $27.25. 

Hay. No. 2. per ion, car lots. $21 to

nominal.

Peas No. 2. nominal 
Buckwheat. No. 2. nominal. 
Rye, No. 2, 1.40. nominal. 
Ontario flour. 90Cheese, finest easterns, 14c. to 15r 

Butter, choicest creamery. 28 %c to 7 
28 3-4c. '

Eggs, selected. 36c.

per cent, patent, 
bulk seaboard, 90 per cent pat

ent. nominal, in jute bags, Montreal 
and Toronto.

Manitoba floua. track Toronto, cash
prices:
patents, 10.00.

Millfeed, carloads, delivered Mon-

EASTERN SECURITIES 
COMPANY, LIMITED

His Costly Saving.
"I didn't see you in town 

fey." said Winks.
•‘No," replied Blinks. "1 had a treal frei?hts- beg included; bran, 

room that needed papering and paint- ton' 2-'> 00 to 27.00; ehorts. per ton, 
ing and 1 thought I'd stay at home and jr, 0° t0 29 0°: f***d flour, 1.60 to 1.76. 
do It myself. But can’t stop to talk— Ha>- No. 1. per ton. baled, track 
I'm in a hurry."’ Toronto. 17 00 to 19.00; mixed. 8.00 to

“What’s up?" 10.00; straw, 10.00 per ton. car lots.
“Well, I’ve got to take my business .

•nft to the cleaners and I 
•top at Blank’s and order a

finn patents, 10.50; second

St. John, N. B.

Halifax. N. S.

new car
pet and then look up some painters 
And paperhangers to—to get them to
pet the finishing 
room, you know.’’

touches on that

Made Him Think, Alright.

Osprey Fea then Gan Now 
Had Without Cruelty tc 

the Birds.

FISHER-FOLK HAVE 
DOMESTICATED MR

Moult Four Time» Each Y 
—Coveted Plumes Secu 
Without Pain.

sklcutta, June 1»—The ooatrm 
leTto whether the beautiful 4< 
plume of the smaller aigrette 
monly known as the “oeprey 
can be placed on the world « mat 
without cruelty to the birds has 
received a treeh lmpetue from ai 
tide published by a Karachi r 
paper. In the old daye large qu 
ties of this beautiful plumage wa 
ported from India and they lai 
accounted for the important pos 
occupied by feathers In the lie 
Indian exports down to the m

The oeprey feather, however, 
obtained chiefly til Bengal end 
drae—by revoking cruelty whict 
plied the maàeacre and «low e: 
tlon of one of the fairest of < 
creatures.

In 1902 the new Indian Oust 
Act prohibited “the taking by •» 
land out of British India of skin 
feathers of all birds other thaï 
meetlo except (a) feathers o 
triches, (b) skins and featheri 
ported bona fide as specimens 

Jjfetlve of natural history. ïVotn 
Slate the foreign trade ifi the ai| 
Wilume, although large, has been 

and has been achieved eolel 
evading the customs officers.

Successfully Domesticated.

For long It has been known in 
that successful efforts have 
made, particularly in Bind, tc d 
tlcate the smaller aigrette, an 
long ago as 1914 an article voni 
eil to several scientific Journals 

| dia and America—among then 
p Scientific American—described 

progress made.
Freeh inquiries have again 

made this year in Sind and 
claimed, on what is evidently t 
and scientific authority, that at 
100 aigrette farms now exist ii 
Sind area alone. The farms an 
erally speaking, not migratory 
hence the crueltiee attendant c 
transference of the birds fror 
place to another—cruelties
largely to the necessity °f ten 
tiy blinding the birds to prevent 
harming themeeleves and one a 

i'—are eliminated. Where a sup 
Jftsh and water Is permanent th< 

M remains permanent.

Well Housed and Treater

feat

:
s

“The ‘'farmers” are the fish 
Of the inland waters of the prt 
The birds are weU treated. Tb 
described 
housed tn weUnventilated etru 
well looked after and well fed. 
1,700 birds personally seen 
farms by the collector of T 
Baker (a senior official in thi 
Civil Service) no case of bllnc 
ill treatment was discovered, 
space alio ted to each bird on 
is 30 to 40 ctiblc feet. The 
are in the open and are access 
air and light. The necessity ol 
birds has disappeared, now 
breeding is in regular process.

Moult Four Times Yearty 
With regard to the astonish 

that the smaller t

1 being comti

■

sertlon
moults no leas than four times 
the reports now summarised i 
animous in declaring this to 
positive tact The two summer 
however, only give a very 11 

of the famous plumage.
As regards the pain once i 

to be attendant on plucking, it 
sorted on the authority of an 
who Is also a keen ornithologl 
the abstraction of the plumes 
right season and in the humât 
ion now practiced occasions t 

inconvenience than !
I

no more 
sioned by the plucking of a h« 
the human head.

FACTS ABOUT MAN.

There are 627 muscles in i
body.

A man's brain contains a t 
lion cells.

Man's brain Is twice se large 
of any animal.

A man is generally heavies 
fortieth year.

A manls heart weighs ebou 
pound.

Man is the only animal wh 
trils open downward.

k Normal man’s pulses beat < 
t > the minute, woman’s 80 and
120.

The average man paces * 
108 paces to the minute,

Man's voice is produced 
united action of 44 muscles,

Man’s bonee are in three 
long, in the arms and legs', 
shoulder blades, and short on 
lar. In the wrist.

The cubic content of eni 
man's skull is $4 inches; ol U 
eavage, 82 inches; of the g. 
inches.

Good Comebacks,
I “How do you feed T I hoard 

To Use old shoes jhe's throi 
And lhe old shoes sold with 
“My goodness, I feel all we

“How 4» you feel V I heard 
To hn old skirt she's tkiwi 

I And hack tq her comes tn* 
r /‘flh. why did you cut roe a<

S

Mr. Multikids—I tell 
fellow. It does a 
to get out among

you. old
man like you good 
his married friends, 

surrounded by their children, 
him kindlier thoughts and pll 

* sort of thing, don't yon think?”
|f Mr. Oldbach—Sure thing?

^ little devils make me think tar 
L charitable of Herod

Gives
that

These

Wheat Market BAR SILVER

London, June 18—Bor silver, 86%d. 
per ounce; bar gold, 108e., 2d. Money. 
4 per cent.

Discount rates, short bills, 6 3-8 per 
cent.; three months' bills, 6 1-2 per 
cent.

For International TradeWinnipeg, June 18—The firmness 
on the local wheat market at the open
ing, due to possible crop damage1 In 
the United State»’ wheat belt, disap
peared as the morning went on and 
prices re lapsed to levels that showed 
very llttWs change on the day. Trad
ing was very light and local today. 
The close was 1-2 to 1 1-8 oents lower.

Cash wheat demand continued good 
early In the session, and the premiums 
advanced two cents, attributed large
ly to the scarcity of offerings. When 
the demand was satisfied, the prem
iums dropped beck again to around 
yesterday's close All grades of oats 
and certain grades of barley are in 
demand, but offerings are light. Con
siderable business in oats is being 
worked from day to day for export

Wheat—July, l.ïô ; October, 1.38%

/CANADA’S imports in the fiscal year of 
^ 1919-20 amounted to #1,064,516469 and its 

eipete to #1^86^)8,709, • toed fade of 
#2.35,.i7*8t<- In financing the many transac
tions that go to make op auch » volume ef buri
ne», banking experience and resources ire of 
paramount importance.

The Bank of Montreal has been muting the 
machina of Canada in import end export trade 
for eve too years. It has built up in inter
national banking orgeniation drat offers ertep- 
nonel facilities to those doing business with 
outside countries.

The Manager of any Branch of this Bant will be 
glad to hare ybu discuss banking facilities with 
him or you may consult on any problem connected 
with international trade direct with the Foreign 
Department àt the Head Office in Montreal, 
where complete statistical and other information 
is kept on file. (

LONDON OIL».

London, June 18—Calcutta ltneeed. 
£21; linseed oil, 34s.; sperm oil «36.

Petroleum. American reined, Is., V- 
ttd.; spirits. Is., 1014d.

Turpentine spirits 79s.
Roein, American strained, ITe.; type 

O.. 18s.
Tallow, Australian, 39s.

■

bid.
Oats—July, 46%: October, 45% of 

tered.
Cash prices:—Wheat, No. 1 North

ern. 1.84; No. 2 Northern, 1.85; No. 3 
Northern, 1.77; No. 4, 1.67; track 
Manitoba, Saskatchewan and Alberta.

*

1.75.
Oats. Ne. 2, c.w . 47%; No. 3, c.w., 

43%; extra No 1 feed. 43%; No. 1 
feed. 41%; No. 2 feed. 4V%;
46%.

CHICAGO

Chicoko, June is—Uoae:
Wheat — July. 129%; September,

1.23%.
Corn—July, 63%; September. 64% 
Oats—July, 3S%: September. 39%. 
Pork—July, 17 66: September, 17.80. 
Lard—July, 9.92; September, 10.25.

V

Stab Africa, Jrnka, AmttaJada, Oma,Japm, or da
JtVtf Indca, will fimd à ta deir ****** * am.other Government of Newfoundland 1s- 

were weaker and there waa very 
little activity in Industrial 
There was a good demand for Mon
treal Tram A Power 6's 1924. City rf 
Outremont 6’e 1922, City of Verdun 
6’s 1923, Province of Ontario 6’s 1928 
and Province of Alberta 6’s 1922 with 
very little change in prices.

****** Wid da Forai* Department *t de Hoad 
Oft* m Montreal.

BANK OF MONTREAL
Paid-up Capital $22,MS,m 

Rest $22,IH,H0
Total Assets In Excess of IKN.IN.tH

McDougall & cowans
Members Montreal Stock Exchange. < ■

58 Pnnce William Street, St John, N.B. w
Blanch Office»: Ottawa, Toronto, Winnipeg, Halifax, y 

HEAD OFFICE. MONTREAL
Oder» executed on all Exchangee.

Jt

Since the Quebec Commission have taken over 
our complete stock and Warehouses in 

Montreal we have established 
ourselves at

?

295 Queen Street
OTTAWA

-

and are prepared to fill orders from New Brunswick 
from our Ottawa establishment

i
Catalogue and Prices Sent on Application.

wm. e. McIntyre, limited
/.

Queen Street, Ottawa295

.
Ittiife I . i

: Trim Blue.

■toll (telling experience rat 
t'tWW teller1»)—She wee Just telling 

*e «bout nom» gentlemen In blue 
IB I would meet—

—Well, did roe meet them? 
certelnly did. for Just then 

coppers broke in.

for-

KK

Bonds Due 1930

V

We Offer Province of

NEW BRUNSWICKi

W. E. MAHON & CO.
101 Prince Wm. St. 

St. John, ^ B. 177 Hollis 8t. 
Halifax, N. S.

%
Awv --------------- ----....; I. N.—row. A 1

—■ ■- 8—- = « Sr

AdERETIE FARM 
ARENOWCOMMO 

IN EAST IND1

y

THE STANDARD’S FINANCIAL SECTION

City of Moncton 
6 p. c. Bonds

Due 1941 
at 98 1-2 and Int.

Town of Campbellton 
6 p. c. Bonds

Due 1951 
at 96.63 and Int.

Victory Bonds
All Issues 

Bought and Sold

J. M. Robinton & Son»,
Ltd.

Moncton — St. John 
Fredericton

We Cannot Die! ■ire 1
Your lawyer, your brother, your friend, may “Go 

West at any time, leaving your business affairs in 
such a condition as to render your wife and children 
almost desperate through lack of knowledge of business 
methods.

The safest executor is the one which, with full 
experience, is always on the job to protect the inter
ests of those you leave behind.

THE EASTERN TRUST COMPANY ;
St. J^hn, N. B.
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