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lbalf black, but no yellow ; iiîteî uccli r i egioti, and about bîase of anteînnoe,
blackened ; labrumi atud lower corners of face yellow, ibe yellow extending
as a suffusion, with no defined mnargin, across tlte clypeus and half-way up
the sides of the face ; antentire entirely briglit ferrtigiîîous, the flagellum
stout; mesothorax coarsely rouglteîed, red, with a nuedian black stripe, but
no yellow ; prothorax black or alinost. with its upper border and the
tubercles yellow ; pleura red, with a large triangular yellow patch in front ;
area bctween the wings and the hind legs black ; metathorax red, witli four
yellow spots, the lowcr otues large, tbe upper round aud placed ou the sides
of the enclosure, looking like eycs, tire whole combination rcsembling a
picture of a skull soniewhat ; tegulie red, shining but punctured ; wings
nioderately dusky, the tips darkcr. stigmia brighît ferruginous, nervures
fuscous ; legs red, ltiud lemora blackened behiud, anterior sud middle
femora with black behind at base ; abdomen minutely roughcned, rather
shiny, red with broad yellow bauds on segments 2 to 5, that on 5 iuter-
rupted laterally;, first segment black basally, sud with an obscure yellow
baud, the middle third of svhich is wanting ; fifuh segment fringed with
silvcr-white hiair ; pygidial plate broad shovel-shaped ; venter red, witlî a
large transverse pyriforni ycllow mark ou each side of segments 2 and 3,
and two crescent-shaped yellow marks on 5.

Milwatukee, Wisconsin, June 8, 1903. (Dr. S. Graenicher.) Locks
much like N Colorat'eiisis, Ckll., but smaller, sud differing iu many
details.,

Neaa sphaerioga.rter, Ckll., var. « -. ~ Leugth, about 8 mm.;
black, with lemon-yellow markings, and some red, but noue on thorax ;
mandlibles sud sisterior coxaS simple ; basal nervure passing a short
distance basad of transverso-miedial ; tîtird antennal joint a little sîtorter
than foutrth. H-ead sud thorax coarsely roughened, and quite halry, the
dorsal hair tiuged with fuscous ; head broad, facial quadrangle much
broader than long ; no yellow about lsead, cheeks entirely black ; labrum,
utandibles, malar region, broad anterior margits of clypetîs, sud a minute
itîcoitspicuous stripe on each stde of face adjacent to eye sud small spot
at sttmmit of eye, aIl ferruginous ; aitteun. ecntirely ferruginous, sttffused
uvitîs blackislî above, excepr the third joint; ulpper border of prothorax,
most of tubercles, sud two large conflutent spots ou scutelluin, yellow ; the
rest of the thorax is black ; sides of metathoractc ares with couspicuotis
griioves ; legs black tri about the middle of tire fenuora (more behind>, and
beyond that red, te middle and lîiud tibias with s blackish streak belîiîîd,
thie kutees incliued to be >'ellowish, the biud tibire with a yellow stripe on


