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saiving. It lias becni a liîavy and trou-
blesomie job. *We design to Nveatlier-
board oui' bouse, niake sents l'or the
chutrelh, and seliou'i bouse, &c.

A-pril 4t-Ihave been very biîsy for
neai'ly a wveek past in arrang'ing our
house. Our servant mail Charles lins
mloved awvi as bis wifè whio lias been
our cook ail alorg got radier tired of the
business, and wce were not sorry. A

goo(l servant girl here would be wortli
gold.

7 th-Yesterda.y bein g Good Fridaty
we litîa preaclxing, and M1r. Bi'niston and
fainily %verc withil us front il A. M. iiritil
evoning. To-day 1 have been exces-
sively bus.y ; to-inorrow bcing our Quai'-
terly iMeetingç. 1 hiave mnade out the
ticlkets l'or nil the miembers, and nmet the
leaders, and had a couineil %'ith, thei.

iNOTES 0F MISSIONAPY TRÂVEL.
Extract of' Letier., f,'oi thLe Rev. Thomèas lfooleey.

SuK I~PIUS, J3Iwnncsota JTsrrifory,
Aine 11/4'55 -We are now> about 1,500
iniles from you, "fo4-r f,'om the busy
haunits of mc," as regards city or town
life, ighn and cornmingliing, iii sonie
casels, withl people of a strangre speech.
Time's feathery wing, subtIe îwd noise-
less t'ead, dissolving touch, and all-lev-
ciiingr scythe reîninds us that

"'l'ie hours are %,ieiiezs angciz,
That stili go g.iiiîg7 hy.
Aud bezir eaeh iiiiiiuteýs record up,
To li -who sits on igh;

and on that aceounit I1 would endeavor
to improve the passing moments by
further communications relative to our
jouru eyi ngs.

We left Chicago on the l9thi instant,
satisfied that we were Ieaving an imnpor-
tant and rising city. The Court Ilouse,
Marine Banik, *Exthange Bank, and Ma-
sonic Hacll are noble buildings: and there
are few indeed to compare with sonie
residetices on Michigan avenue. The
chiurches are capacious, and the stores in
the "City of the faakes," are very large
and wvell stocked. Wge proceeded en
route to Dunfleithl by expres.q, glancing,
as well WCe could, at the varied seenery
by which wea were sux'rounded, which,
wvithi difieulty, we occasionally accom-
plished, as, in addition to the speed at
wvhich we travehled, our chiapeaus were
frequently lifted up on high, in conse-
quence ot' the peeuliar oscillation to,
whic'h we -were subjected . We reached
Rockford station iii time for dinner,
whiere we enjoyed a sumptuons repast,
and were miuch pleased -%vith the cour-
tesy and gentlemanly demeanor of the
principal of the establishment, ivhose
deportmient produced its effeets on ail
connected withi him. How mitch stands
connected with complying -with the

apostolic injunction Il be cotirteouis. "-
The view fr-ot this spot wvas most en-
ch:Lntiflg. The day -wis peculiarly fine.
"il igh-lt have doue lionoî' to Eden before
the entrince of the tempter, have taken
ratik ini the inspired annals of the .world's
chroriology, or h .ve been kzmown in the
inil)erishal)le syllables, ' The evening
and the miomning %verc the first dy>"
We reacýhed Dunleith, (sonie fift'eÉn miles
beyond Galena,) just as Ilthe suri, the
g'eat Ko o-i-noor jew'el of' the universe,
was nà.st sinldng frorn sig'-lt in the nîys-
terions depthis of God's owxî kaleidos-
coptic cabinet. As vrhen the srnile of
inflamcy ia its dreamns is sueýceed1ed by
sadder hues as the scene cliangy(S,-ais
the angels that w%ýhispered to, it were re-
tiring ; so deepened the shadows of this
lovely evening. o'er hill, lawn, river and
lake, as the father of shadows was Ieav-
ing his place ia the skies. Zephyrs
genitly approachied withi thieir incense
offeî'incs, and whispered worship) on the
traek of the retining sun ; the green trees
reverently bowed; the waters ofth le
Mississippi reverently kneeled, and we
felt grrateful for a religion, wvhich. alone
could interpret nature." *We left Dun-
leith, for St. Paul about 9 o'elock in the
evening, on board the Uity Belle, U. S.
Mail Steamer, P. Lo dwick, Commander,

vh ose kitnd and grentlemanly deportment
cannot be too highly euilogrised. The
shades of'eveningr havingr set in ve were
hindered from beholding, for some hours
at least, the beautifuil scenery that skirts
the Mississippi ; but as wve had a voyage
of about 400 miles before us, we looked
forward for a rich treat. The scenery
presented a vast range of lofty hills,
studded ivith trees and brush-wood,
broken lu upon occasionally by somne
quiet sequestered domiciles, and busi-

1855.]


