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5. That the perfon, at whofe inftance any feiz-
ure may have been had, or others int recfid-in-an<
oppofition to fhe fame, fhall take communication
of the faid declaration or moyens, and the feveral
documents fo filed as aforefaid, and make anfwer
thereto, within threc days from the day of filing
the fame, and under the like rules that a defendant
is bound to plead to the merits of a caufe.

6. And it is further ordered, That all and eve.
ry the rules of this Court, refpeéting original fuits
and the courfe of proceeding therein, in fo far as
the fame may be applicable to claims preferred by
oppofition, lhall be flrialy adhered to, as the rules
for proceeding thereupon.

7. To the end, that all perfons interefted in the
levy and returns of executions to'be iffued out of
this Court, may be informed when fuch returns
are made-It is ordered, that the Prothonotary of
this Court do, from time to time, on every day
when any execution may be returned by the She-
riff, and filed of record, fix and place to public
view, in his the faid Prothonotary's office, a lift of
fuch returns, exprefling the names of the parties,
plaintiff and defendart. That the rules of this
Court refpe&ing oppofitions to be made after the
return of executions, ihall be confidered to apply
to the period that the faid lif was fo affixed by the
Prothonotary, in the office aforefaid.

SECTION XXXVIII.

0f Proceedings in respect to Appeal

1. THAT on the allowance of every writ of-ap-
peal, the Proýhonotary in making up the record,
for a due return to fuch writ, do mark numenical-


