
blind mother bèing in the Home just now. We had a fuit
Home last winter, and I am thankful to say no sickness to
speak of. I had a good helper in Miss Groat, the young
person from Edmonton, but she has returned home. Mr. and
Mrs. Holmes returned home on the i ith of August, we were
very glad to see them back. Mr. and Mrs. White are going
back to their own Mission at White Fish Lake; they are build-
ing a little church.and hope to have a good number of people
attend, as there are no Roman Catholics there as yet. Mr.
White speaks and reads so well in the Cree language. St.
Philip's W.A. sent me some very nice presents, also the
Church-of the Epiphany, so I am feeling very well off, and so
encouraged by the kind thoughts of me. If I only had a
helper, I tink I could manage the work for some years to
come ; God, I firmly believe, will give us His blessing if we go

on putting our trust in Him. Thank you for all your kindness
and letters.
Extract of letter from AUl Hallows' School, Yale, B. C., to

Jhe Diocesan President W.A., Toronto.
"Knowing the interest the W.A. take in the progress of this

Indian Mission, I thought you would like to hear of the
closing entertainment, which took place July 15 th. The
pupils have made excellent progress, and are goòd, obedient,
painstaking children. Our School room looked so pretty,
decorated with flowers and ferns, and the children were so
bright and happy, and a large number of friends of the school
were present. Mr. Croucher, our vicar, presided. The prizes
presented to the Indian children, were for best Scripture, best
House and Laundry work, General Proficiency and Conduct,
also for best Monitresses. Their entertainment closed with
prayer, also singing of the National Anthem. Rosa, the young
pupil teacher, deserves great credit for her careful training and
management of the children, in the branches she undertakes.
In conclusion, I'do- most earnestly commend this Mission to
ail members of the W.A., and hope they will favour us with a
bale this coming Christmas, of any nice and useful articles
thefi- kindness may suggest. I am so much interested in all
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