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to do so, that their assistance will bc necdcd
ver shortly.

Thie circînustances in which, in tho Pro-
vidence of God, Clvin Churchi congreg~a-
tion was phiccd by the total destruction,lity
tire, of itS finie building- in April fast, and
the energy and cuterprize wvhicli the mncm-
bers an(1 adlherents have since xnanifestcd,
in undertaking the responsible work of re-
construiction shon]ld certainly command for
thcm the sympathy of ail our congrega-
tions, and the ai(l ot as inany as can give a

hcpig au ii h pesntmnr~nc.We
feel sure we have only to cal) the6 attention
of pasi ors and people to this matter to in-
sure the desired assistance proxnptly. We
are infornicd that the cxtcriur of tîte ncw
Churcli is rapidly adnenrtowvards coin-
pletion, and promises to he one of the flnest
buildings of the kind in Newv Brunswick-
a9 credit alike to the congregation and thîe
Synod to which it belong.-,

Contributions furwarded to, the Secretary
will bce thankfiillv acknowlecd"cd. Those
iu Nova Scotia who miay find ut more con-
venient to, remit to 1Rev. 12. G. MeGregor,
Hlalifax, may do so, and tîjeir contributions
large or suxali will be forwarded without
delay.

Missions of the American Board.

The following is an abstract of the Arne-
ri=a Board's Report for the pastyear:

The graduation of the Mission to the
Sandwich Islands, wirh its fifty-six church-
es and other Christian institutions well es-
tablished, and the transfer of five fields to
the Presbyterian Board-Syria, Persia, the
Gaboon, anti two of the smailer Indian
tribes,-haive given special interest to the
external history of the Board for the yecar
under review. By the transfers the Board
was callcd to part 'vith 21 ordaincd missi-
onaries aîîd one missionaryUpysician, with
162 native preixehers an e~hrs, 19 chai-ch-
es, having- a membcrship of 403-besides
722 communicants in Persia, whcire no se-
patate churches lhad been orgainized,-with
live seminaries, including those for both
sexes, and 89 sehools, contaiuing. 2,281

ý upils. One thousand commnunicanîts have
cen addcd to the churchies on profession of

faitx during the pnst ycar ; la sevcral fields
more titan double the iiumbcr ever reportet
before in any one year.

Tuituisut Eixpi nn.-There are 74 church-
es, with 47 pastors; 49 licenset preachers,
increascd by 21-3 gradîiates frorn the semi-
naries nt M'ýarsovan anti Marash ; 1,380
added to the number of registered Protes-

tants, 5 new churclies, and an addition o,
494 members. Contributions for tht, year
nnd for general henevolence, aunount to
Si9 9026 in gold ; self-supporting ehuirches,
20.

Besides the wvives of missionaries, tivcnty-
seven single ladies are dcvoiing- tîxeniselves
to the elevation of tlieur sex in Ttîrkcyv. Ia
Weste>ri TiSî-y a clnss of 13 graduatcd

and 17 entcred tie TîxeologYical 8exninary
at Marsovan. Ail iincxpcctedl helper lias
appeared la an Arîneniîîn who pi-caches
Dr. Goodel's sermnons to lus people, and
another la a bishop, who converts thîe gold,
silver ornanients of ]lis churcli into menus
of erectlng sehtool-houses. Ia C'entral Tûr-
L-eî thew~ork is so fat advanced that it is
proposed to redîîce the number of stations
trora lie to tîvo.

In Eastera Tiirk-my the fruits of the reviv-
al at Blîlis have been gatlieret into a îvork-
ing clîurclî. The ont-stations at Erzr-oom

ocer the hearts of the niissionaries la tîtat
quarter. Steady growvth marks the work
lu tho Harpoot field. Besides a, strong
chuircli nt the centre, seventcn other
churches hnve been gatheret axnong seven-
ty ont-stations. Althoiigh te 'n-ork is cx-
tending:z, and demaxîiingi inereascd expen-
ditures, yet the incrcase la contribtions
fromn the people cxîablçý titis station to ask,
for 1872, four hundred dollars less tItan it
receivet d 1871. The people gavte the last
year-t$5,ý00,half the cost of the mission;
62 are now tniining for tho minisîry.

I-ZDI,&.-Tlic missions in India hlave been
suffcring for wantof non' missionaries. The
five oldest missionaries in tho ?dalîratta
field have been in India an average of 24
years cach. Ten ordained inissionaries-in
the Madura *kMission average over 20 years
eauh-Dr. Spanlding, of Cylouî, 52 years;
his associatos, -vith a single exception,
average 25 years la OCylon. In the iIf ah-
raita mission a "Native Christian Alliance,"
for evangelistie work, lias been orp,;nized.
The seminaries nt Alîmetinîggr, arc gain.
ing la inflîîencj and efficleuîey. New ln-
terest lias been awakencd in behaîf of wo-
men, andi fourteen Bible women nssist the
ladies of the mission.

The number of churclies la the Mladttra
Mission hs 28, meznbership, 1,403. 95 reccir-
cd oit profession in 1870. At lcaist one-
fourth of the salary of ecdi native luastor, 15
now paid by lus owvn churclu. In Cej1In,
spiecil religions i,îterest seems to, centre ini
tee Native Evuuîgelical Society. Its Anlni-
versaries have an interet to the (ceylon
Christians, mucli like thuat of the nîetings
of tho Ainericani Board ln titis coîuntry,
The female seminaries continue to enjoy
the blessings of the lloly Spirit la the con-
version of pûpils.

CaiNÂk.-.Notwitlistandingr, the disturi-
ances a larger number have beca rcceivcd
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