
OU spili dlean-up passes test

A test and demonstration of the Canadian
Marine Drilling Ltd. (Canimar) contingency
plan and oil spil ldean-up equipment at
Tuktoyaktuk Harbour, held in the North-
west Territories last month, lias met al
requirements of the operating conditions
of the Federal Government. It was ob-
served by officiais of the Canadian Coast
Guard, Department of Fisheries and the
Environmnent and Department of Indian
and Northemn Affairs. (Canar, a subsi-
diary company of Dome Petroleumn Ltd.,
is the firm which conducts the drilling of
exploratory oit and gas wells in the Beau-
fort Sea.)

Because earlier tests this year at Tuk-
toyaktuk met with only partial success,
Canmar was directed to repeat the exer-
cise. Last month's test was the culmina-
tion of two weeks of intensive exercises
and training.

Dockyard spilis
The procedure for dockyard spilis invol-
ves a 500-foot long, 38-incli Navy boom,
which is permanently attached to the
dock, and deployed from the pre-posi-
tioned containers by a small craft to sur-
round the dock-handling area. Deploy-
ment timne is about two minutes. The spit-
led product is then extracted from the
contained area by a Spate pump and is
either disposed of or reprocessed.

Inshore booms
For protection of environmentally-sensi-
tive areas such as shorelines, fi-sh spawn-
ing and habitat areas, areas used by ma-
rine mammals, marshes and waterfowl
nesting areas, etc., a 1,000-foot boom is
towed by a Northern Transportation Com-
pany barge and depliyed by the barge or
by jet-powered craft in waters too shal-
low for the barge.

In the latest test, the boom was placed
in one shallow bay of Tuktoyaktuk Har-
bour, anchored to the shoreline, released,
towed to a second site some 400-500
yards away, redeployed and anchored.
The complete exercise, which was con-
ducted to test the capability of respond-
ing quickly to changing conditions, took
only two hours.

Pollution-barge test
The principal lime of defence against pot-
lution froni a maj or offshore spili or btow-
out is the pollution barge.

The large craft (about 100 by 50 feet),

manoeuvred by a separate tug, contains
two Arctic booms and an oil-skimmer.
The two booms are towed by other tugs
in a "Y" configuration into the path of an
oit spili, so as to direct the spill towards
the skimmer equipment.

The crude oA or product is then taken
aboard the pollution barge, heated to a
combustible temperature, and disposed of
by buming from elevated flare nozzles.

To provide this type of protection in
ice-covered waters, a $ 7-million prograni
of researchi and equipment development
was approved by the Federal Government
in 1976.

News briefs decision, however difficult".
Scientists at the Bedford Institute of

Federal Finance Minister Jean Chré- Oceauography in Halifax, Nova Scotia,
tien recently stated at a federal-provincial have discovered a marine wonn (the coni-
finance ministers' meeting that over the mon arenicola marina) that thrives on oA
next few years the real growth of the eco- pollution. In fact, a heavily Polluted area
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