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C.P.R. Betterments, Construction, Etc.

St. John, N.B., Terminalo.-Application
bas been made to the city council for a sec-
tion of the market slip î8o by 12 ft. It iS
proposed to build a pile wbarf, witb ware-
bouse, to be used for the local import and ex-
port trade, using the Sand Point warebouses
for tbrougb traffic only.

A warebouse 200 ft. by 40 ft. is under con-
struction on the Rodney wbarf, and is ex-
pected to be completed this faîl. D. C. Clark
bas the contract. Additional yard space for
about 400 cars bas been provided at the Bay
sbore yards. (Aug., pg. 270.)

Switches on Atantic Dlvlsion.-About
135 sets of soutbern pine ties were used in
renewing tics on tbe switcbes on the Atlantic
division tbis year.

McAdanm Jet. Statlon.-We are officially
informed that tbere is not the sligbtest foun-
dation for the press report that tbe name of
this station is to be cbanged to Van Horne
Jct.

Sherbrooke, St. Guillaume and Newport
Sections.-New bridges, consisting of mas-
onry abutments and steel spans, are being
completed at Ricbford, Stevens' Milîs and
East Richford, to replace ligbter or wooden
structures.

A siding bas been put in between Sutton
Jct. and Sutton to help trains that bave to
double tbe grade at this point; a siding, balf-

a-mile long, bas been put in between St. Phil-
ippe and L'Acadie, and the sidings at St.
Constant, St. Philippe, Quebec Southern Jct.,
Cowansville, Mansonville, Newport, Foster
and Eastman, have been lengthened by about
î,ooo ft. each.

The work of double-tracking the line be-
tween Brigbam Jct., and Farnbiam, 6 miles,
was commenced on Oct. 2, and on Oct. io,
two miles of road-bed had been graded and
ties laid ready for tracklaying and ballast-
ing. The work, wbich is being donc by day-
labor under the supervision of the Co. 's offi-
cers, wvas expected to be com-pleted by the
end of Oct. The object of providing the
double track is to facilitate the movement of
trafflc in and out of Farnhamn yard, as tbe
haulage capacity of an engine between Farn-
ham and Newport, and Farnham and Megan-
tic, is 40% less than between Outremont and
Farnham.

Increased accommodation for tbe storage
and handling of freight bas been provided at
St. Guillaume, St. Pie, Eastman, Magog and
Mansonville by additions to tbe freigbt sheds.
The shed for storing flour at Richford, 8o by
36o ft., is being doubled; a new station and
freiglit sbed bas been erected at Bulwer; the
coal chiites at Farnham and Megantic have
been increased to nearly double their capa-
city, and a new engine bouse is being built at
Stanbridge, to replace one destroyed by fire
last winter.

The line from Brigbam Jct. to Sberbrooke,
58 miles, in being relaid witb 8o lb. rails.

Montreal Shops.-Tbe new locomotive and
car sbops are to be located in tbe eastern
part of Montreal, adjacent to the Co. 's Quebec
line. The grounids are about 35o acres in ex-
tent, being about 4,500 by 2,000 ft. Thepur-
pose of these sbops is the concentration in one
plant of a large part of tbe repairing of the
locomotives and passenger coaches used on
the road, at tbe same time making large pro-
vision for tbe manufacture of locomotives,
passenger and sleeping coacbes, as well as
freigbt cars. Tbe total floor space of the
buildings planned for immediate construction,
and sbown on the plan on page 379, is about
750,000 square feet, or over 17 acres. Tbe
buildings will be of pressed brick on rubble
stone and concrete foundations. Tbe trusses
will be combination trusses on steel columns
for the sbops of tbe car department, and steel
trusses for tbe locomotive sbops, the black-
smith sbop and tbe foundry. Tbe bot blast
systemn of heating will be used througbout.
The passenger car sbops, wben completed,
will be able to turn out i00 new cars a year,
and repair 900 old ones. The freigbt car
sbop will bave a capacity Of 25 to 3o new
cars a day, and will be able to repair i oo cars
a day. The locomotive erecting and machine
sbop and the boiler shop will bave a capac-
ity Of 75 new locomotives a year, and will

be able to repair 400 a year. The wbeel
foundry is designed to turn Out 250 wbeels a
day. The details of the power bouse and
the power equipment bave not yet been
worked out, but electric transmission of
power will be used tbroughout the individual
machine and group motors in the several
sbops. The sizes of the buildings are as fol-
lows:-
Freight car shop ........................... 540x'07f.

Plan*nnil.........................50OXI27Cabinet shop.......................... ... 290X6Z
Hardware storage and upholstering shop (two

atOrieq)................................. 29OX62
Passenger car paint shop.................. 672x io
Passenger car erecting shop............... 67-x ion
Truck shp........................... .128
Car machine shop .................. ý:x3
Blacksmith shop ................ ...... .... 6,oxî3o
Grey iron foundry ......................... 380x125
Machine and locomotive erecting shop .. qooxi6o
Boiler shop............................... 300xi2o0
Wheel foundvy ....... ..................... 170x,10
Froe shop ........... ..................... 250xi00
Drying kiln ............................... 250XO00
Power boue.............................. inoxîzo
Office....................... .............. 11OX60

Contracts bave been let for seven of tbe
buildings, and work bas already been started.
Lessard & Harris, of Montreal, are erecting
two buildings.for the construction of passen-
ger cars, one for freight cars, and the plan-
ing milt, and Loomis & Sons, of Sherbrooke,
are erecting tbree buildings for the furniture
and upbolstery sbops. (Aug., pg. 270.)

Northern Colonization By.-Construction
on the extension of tbis line from Labelle to
Nominingue, Que., about 26 miles, was com-
menced in Julv, and it was expected that
tracklaying would be commenced in Oct. D.
R. Mc Donald & Co., Williamstown, Ont.,
are the contractors. (June, pg. 27o, and Oct.,
pg. 333-)

Ste. Agathe and Beaeonsifleld Stations.-
New stations bave been completed at Ste.
Agatbe and Beaconsfield, Que. Botb are
larger buildings tban the old stations, and
bave been equipped ivitb enameled iron sta-
tion name plates by the Acton Burrows Go.,
Toronto.

Main Transcontinental Lino.-Sir Wm.
Van Horne, wbo recently returned from a trip
over the C.P.R. to Vancouver, bis first for
tbree years, says that the line was in fine con-
dition tbrougbout. Practically aIl of the orig-
inal temporary structures bave disappeared
and tbe greater part of tbe main line bas been
relaid witb rails of the heaviest description.
Extensive additions bave been made to the
sidings, and there is every facility for hand-
ling traffic. The extent to whicb tbis work bad
been donc was given more specifically by Sir
Ibos. Shaugbnessy in a recent interview. He
said that 8o% of the line from Montreal to the
Pacific coast had been transformed into a per-
manent road, millions of dollars having been
spent in replacing the teînporary structures;
and tbat by the end Of 1903 the wbole
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