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lishments that make Paris what it is to-day— the
Place de la Concorde, the Champs filys^es, and
many of the palaces of the Faubourg St. Germain— date from this reign.

One of the vicious cDnditions of the time was
the separation in sympathies and interests of the
four great classes of the nation, — clergy, nobles,

burghers, and peasants ; and each of these, again,
divided itself into incoherent fragments. France
was an aggregate of disjointed parts, held together
by a meshwork of arbitrary power, itself touched
with decay. A disastrous blow was struck at the
national welfare when the Government of Louis XV.
revived the odious persecution of the Huguenots.
The attempt to .scour heresy out of France cost
her the most industrious and virtuous part of her
population, and robbed her of those most fit to
resist the mocking scepticism and turbid passions
that burst out like a deluge with the Revolution.
Her manifold ills were summed up in the King.

Since the Valois, she had had no monarch so
worthless. He did not want understanding, still

less the graces of per.son. Tn his youth the people
called him the " Well-beloved ;

" but by the mid-
dle of the century they so detested liim that he
dared not pass through Paris, lest the mob should
execrate him. He had not the vigor of the true
tyrant; but liis languor, his hatred of all effort,
his profound selfishness, his listless disregard of
public duty, and his effeminate libertinism, mixed
with superstitious devotion, made him no loss a
national curse. Louis XHI. was equally unfit to


