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aant Sovereign of Holy Land Con-
clave, No. 26, Toronto, on the 7th of
Novexnber, 1874, and appointed In-
tendent General of the Toronto Dis-
triet for the year 1874-5, and has
been the Grand Sovereign of this
body. Hoe is the Representative of
the Grand Impenial Council of Scot-
land of the United States.

Brother iDaniel Spry is also Past
Grand Master of the Grand Lodge of
Royal Ark Marinons of the Dominion
of canada.

Iii. I3ro. Daniel Spry, 82%, received
the degrees of the A. & A. S. B. up
to and including tbe 18', in Immanuel
Rose Croix Obapter, Orillia, on the
4tb day of October, .1871, and subse-
quently received the dogmeos from tle
191 to the 820 in Moore Sovereign Con-
sistory, S.IP.R.S., 820, in the city of
Hamilton, in whicb body ho takes a
great interest, and now occupies tbe
position of Grand Prelate. Rie is also
a charter member of Toronto Sover-
elgu Chapter of IRose Croix.

As this record shows, M. W. Bro.
Spry has, from, the day ho first saw
Masonic Light up to the present time,
taken an active and lively interest in
ail the branches of Masonry, and stili
continues to do so; and from the
goldeni opinions be ia winning from
ail quartera, and tbe skill and energy
ho bas displayed on the occasion of
overy visit ho bas made since he bas
occupied the high and honorable posi-
tion of Grand Master of the Grand
Lodge of Canada, we are confident
bis reign will be one of the most suc-
cesecful and profitable to the Craft.
Ris efforts are higbly appreciated by
ail, and bis work ia always so wel
done that it i8 not surprising lie 2aproving one of the most popular offi-
cors the Grand Lodge bas had at itsJ
.head for many years.

.1 MASONIO DTY.
Volumes have been written and

thousands of orations delivered,
pointing out to the Craft the rea],
full and proper ineaning of Masonic
duty. Every neophyte bas it ira.
pressed as he listons to the pure and
simple ritual of the Entered Appren.
tice degree; the Fellow Crafb "lduring
bis passage", notes that throughout
the whole vein of the ceremonial rang
a sober rivulot, teachiug the Hiramite
the meaning and definition of Ma-
sonie duty, and ho who has entened
the Sanctum Sanctorum and linelt in
prayer before the altar, as did our
ancient martyred Grand Master, and
Who, like him bas tried to escape by
tho different gates, and witnessed the
tragedy-tbat glanions syinbol of the
resurrection-cannot have failed to
have been impressed with the sacred
obligations, that be lias not anly
taken in the preceding degrees, but
especially in this. Hoe must in his
inmost soul feel that ]ho bas entered
upon a career that demands mucli of
bim, and that to be a true follower of
tbe Widow's Son, he mnust indeed ho
very careful and very faithful in re-
gard h bis Masonie duty.

There is much, very mucli, im2plied
in these two littie words. They com-
prehend a wbole encyclopoedia of
virtues, honest maxima and trutha,
tbat it behooves every brotber to
8tudy, and study tborougbly. There
is no such Word as "Slotb" in the
Masonie tongue, and there ia no such
thing as "Idieness" in Masonry. A
man applies for initiation of bis own
free will and accord, ho states hi l
not actuated by s"mercenary or other
unwortby motives," and on theae


