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santly to describe their numerous representatives, and interpret
their singular structure. lIt ,took him ten years to work out ' The
Genera and Species of Orebidaceous Plants,' and another ten years
to complete various memoirs on these plants, which lie published
under the name of 1 Folia Orchidacea.'

The writings of Dr. Liindlcy formi quite a library by themselves.
Therc arc amongst them. both. elementary books, and works inten-
ded merely for leading men of science. His ' Fossil Flora of Great
BriVain' bias endeared him to geologists, and bis various works on
gardening to hiorticulturists. Perhaps the xnost widely known of
ail bis works 1 The Vegetable Ki ngdom,' which appeared in 1846,
and gâves a condensed account of the structure, geographical distri-
bution and uses of plants, arranged according to the Natural sys-
temn as understood by him. lit was an amplification of bis carlier
attempts iii the saine direction,, and bias been found extreme]y use-
fui. Notwitbstanding that its general. arrangement of tbe Natural
Orders lias neyer been followed by any botanist, it would bc diffi-
cu to name a work which bias more advanced the cause Dr. Lind-
ley had so mucli at heart, than this book. Wlien it first appcared,
it was stercotyped, and the new editions are znerely the old matter
wviVh sone, cancels and supplemcntary pages. IlI can do nothing
more witb -*t" wc beard bim say a few ycars ago; Il I m getting
too old to be-ale to sit up baif of the nigb,,ts as I used to do for-
merly; and I mnust leave it to yoincr men to finish what I bave
begun." lie was rigit ; lic wvas no longer able to sit up baîf the
niglit dceply engaged in study. As 1V was, lie had worked too
hard, a-ad overstrained bis brain. His memory ,wbich bad always

beenmos reentvebegan to fail ; and he suddcniy found thathe

must give up ail mental labor at least, for a time. Thiere was a
slight iniprovement after lic badenjoyed. some, montis, of undistur-
bcd rest, but iV soon became painfuily evident to ail that the
streng,,±i of this mental giant was broken, tbat Lindley bad laid
down bis powerful pen, neyer Vo, take 1V up again. Hie bad to
give up bis connection witli the Horticultural Society altogether,
and resigun the Prof'essorship, of Botany at Ulniversity Colleg--e,
whicb lie had filled for many years. lie died of apoplcxy on
Wedncsday, the lst inst., at bis residence on A&cton Green, deepiy
regý,rettcd bý a large circle of fricnds.

]ir. Lindley was a member of most scientifie societies ln ail parts
of the world, and bis name is lield dear wberever science is culti-
vat-ed and truc genius apprcciated -London Athcnoeunb.
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