
by way of treats to various persons, about $3 was received
from Turpin for that purpose. This would mean, as the
witness 8aid, a treat of 30 persons, unless some were treated
twice. Probably the money thu8 exponded by Turpin was
part of the money lie had received from Plummer, and, as-
suming that the persons so treated were voters, it would b.
a corrupt practice, on the part of Turpin. But 1 do not find
any section of the Act which enables me to, fasten it upon
Pluturner as the person who supplied the money thus un-
lawfully expended by Turpin, as in the case of a person who
advanees nioney to be expended in bribery (sec. 59 (c) ), or
for the purpose of betting (sec. 164 (2ý ). 'Indeed, this form
of stating a corrupt practice is, to me, quite nove1 . But even
if the evidence can lie regarded as sufficient 'to establish what
sec. 162 (2) cails "extensive> or general or misefllaneous"
treating, or the corrupt practice struck atý by sec. 163 (1),
1 thinlk that agency has not been made out on the part of
either Plummer or Turpin. The former was present as a
delegate at the nominating convention, thougli how or wheu
lie was appoinited did not appear. Then lie spoke on behaif
of the respondent at one or two meetings, and looked in at
some of the anialler meetings,-the committee meetings;- but
is not shewn to have taken any part in theni. Hie appears,
in short, to have been a sort of free lance.

Charges 78 to 81, inclusive, and charge 90, are, except
charge 90, personal charges in respect of the $235 paid to
Morreault, of which $100 was paid by the respondent him-
self; $110 by one Hand, an agent of the respondent, and $25
by one Thoxupson, another agent; and hoth of the latter were
paid with the respondent's asseni or knowledge. I find that
none of these sunis were paid with any corrupt intention or
for any corrupt purpose, or with intent that Morreault should
expend thexu or any part of thexu corruptly. Morreault was
flot a volunteer nor a voter. Hie was a professional, man, and
the suan received by huxu was not an extravagant payment
for hie tume and expenses. But, aithougli it was not a cor-
rupt payment, it was, 1 think, an illegal one. I find no au-
thority to include a payment for the purposes Morreauit was
exnployed for (taking theni as a whole) in the personal ex-
penses of the candidate or bis other election expenses. It
was, at ail events, illegal as net having been made through
the respondent's financial agent, as required by sec. 197, and
there was, moreover, in respect of it, a distinct infraction of
sec. 201 of the Election Act in the omission to include it in
the detailed statement of the candidate's election expenses.
The transaction was a blameworthy one, weil calculated to


