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treat lawyer and business man, 
who will receive the honorary 
degree of Doctor of Civil Law.

' After the conferring of honor­
ary degrees, Mr. Menon will 
deliver the Convocation address 
which will be of prime import­
ance due to his role in inter­
national politics, and the world 
situation today. Following Mr. 
Menon’s speech there will be a/ 
presentation of prizes and de­
grees in course. A reception in 
the new McConnell Hall will 
close this year’s fall Convoca­
tion.

following which the honorary 
degrees will be conferred.

Those to be honored at the 
ceremony are: V. K. Krishna 
Menon, minister of defence for 
India and leader of his country’s 
delegation to the United Na­
tions; Sir John Rothenstein, dir­
ector and keeper of the Tate 
Gallery, London; J. D. Johnson, 
Montreal, chairman of the Board 
of Canada Cement Company 
Limited and governor of Mc­
Gill University, all of whom will 
receive the honorary degree of 
Doctor of Laws; and A. J. P. 
Taylor, noted historian from 
Magdalen College, Oxford, and 
William H. Howard, Q.C., Mon-

At 2:15 on Thursday after- 
the academic procession L ’noon

will wend its way down the hill 
to the Lady Beaverbrook Rink 
for the traditional Convocation
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ceremony.
Lord Beaverbrook, Chancellor 

of the University will take part 
in the proceedings and the chair 
on the platform wiil be taken by 
Lieutenant-Governor J. Leonard 
O’Brien, as the Queen’s repre­
sentative.

Rev. G. Howard Christie, 
minister of Marysville United 
Church will give the invocation. 
The opening address will be de­
livered by Dr. Colin B. Mackay,
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Mr. A. J. P. Taylor,Mr. V. K. Krishna Menon

Classes will be cancelled for 
the ceremony and all students 
are urged to attend. SRC Elections

Two Freshman class repre­
sentatives.

There shall be not more than 
two representatives from the 
same Faculty in .the same class 
except in the case of there being 
no nominations from other facul­
ties.

Nominations are now open 
for the following positions. The 
nominations shall be in writing 
and shall be handed in to the 
acting President or the Secretary 
of the S.R.C. not later than noon 
of Saturday, October 14, 1961.

President and Treasurer of the 
S.R.C.

All nominations for the above 
positions shall be in writing and 
signed by a nominator, a second­
er, and eight other students.

One Junior class represent­
ative.

Two Sophomore class repre­
sentative*.

Secretary-Treasurer of the 
Sehior Class.

Vice-President of the Inter­
mediate Class.

Secretary - Treasurer of the 
Intermediate Class.

Vice-President of the Sopho­
more Class.

President, Vice-President and 
Secretary-Treasurer of the Fresh­
man Class.

All nominations for the above 
positions shall be in writing and 
signed by a nominator, and a 
seconder who shall be members 
of the class concerned.

Mr. William H. HowardMr. J. D. JohnsonSir John Rothenstein

PARAJUMPERS HIT THE AIR
The only girl jumping Satur­

day was Phyllis Westbury, who 
made the first jump of the day 
and due to an unfortunate land­
ing, suffered a broken leg. How­
ever, this has not dampened her 
enthusiasm and when asked if 
she would jump again, she re­
plied, “Yes, as soon as I get my 
cast off.” She stressed that it 
was a freak accident, caused 
when her ’chute turned around, 
making her land with the wind 
instead of against it, thus increas­
ing her landing speed.

This did not affect the spirits 
of the eleven jumpers who fol­
lowed her, several of whom were 
making their first jumps.

Twelve UNB students were 
literally “up in the air” at the 
Blirsville Airport on Saturday 
afternoon as the Para-Jump Club 
swung into action.

For those making their fjrst 
jumps the ’chute opened auto­
matically after a fall of six feet. 
Veteran jumpers like Martin 
Archer-Shee and Dave Peters 
experienced what is known as a 
“free fall”, in which they opened 
their own ’chutes by pulling the 
ripcord after falling for several 
thousand feet.

THE FALL ELECTIONS 
WILL BE HELD ON WED­
NESDAY, OCTOBER 25, 1961.

When asked to describe her 
jump, Phyllis said, “It was the 
most wonderful sensation I have 
ever experienced — like falling 
through soft cotton wool.” She 
hopes to be present next week­
end when the UNB Club hosts 
the Montreal Sky-Divers.
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MESSAGE FROM 
BEAVERBROOKj

The Chancellor sends this 
Message to the Students:

A. J. ?. Taylor, great auth­
ority on European history, 
speaks on Wednesday evening 
at 8:30, October 4th, in the 
Beaverbrook Art Gallery on 
the subject “Soviet Russia and 
the World”. Lord Beaver­
brook has seen Mr. Taylor in 
action and under direct fire 
from an audience. He answers 
questions with extreme ability 
and replies with both wit and 
patience. ✓

His subject for Wednesday 
evening is so exciting that the 
Chancellor suggests that the 
students prepare a series of 
embarrassing questions for the 
speaker who, it is certain, will 
make a case on the left

BEFORE

A NNOUNCEMENTS IS

UNB Band
UNB Band Practice. 
Memorial Hall, 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday, October 4, 1961. 
UNB Band, Convocation. 
Assemble at Rink, 1:45 p.m. 
Thursday, October 5, 1961.

For All Club Executives
The S. R. C. wishes all clubs 

to review and revise their con­
stitution. Details are being 
mailed to you so please check 
your mail bpx. tDURING

Notice To All Seniors
Graduation photos and write­

ups should be in the hands of 
the Yearbook staff no later than 
October 31. Send write-ups, be­
tween 50 and 75 words, to Year­
book Office via campus mail. 
The photos are to be taken at 
either Harvey’s Studio on King, 
or Joe Stone’s on Regent.

Drama Society
Casting for the fall production 

will be held in Carleton Hall, 
Room 139, on Wednesday and 
Thursday of this week, 7-10 
p.m. The play* is “The Girls in 
509” with Bob Ferguson as 
director. Freshmen and Freshie- 
Sophs are especially urged tv 
attend.
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