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Division

settling a labour dispute. One thing is sure, however: this
bill has heen improved by the work of parliament and our
party is pieased that at least some hon. members from
other parties recognized the importance of speaking of
gearing wages to the cost of living. That is something we
have heen clamouring for in ail sectors of the economy and
for once, this evening, our ideas made some headway. 1
heard colleagues of ail parties speak of it.

Mr. Speaker, before ending my remarks, I should like
to say that the 1 arn surprised at my hon. colleague from
York South (Mr. Lewis) paying that he will vote against
the bill, against the back-to-work order, when his party
spent 1 don't know how much time proposing amendments
in conjunction with the government, which amendments
were accepted. Finally, Mr. Chairman, if the NDP vote
against the bill, I wonder what logic there is in their
attitude.

[En glish]
Mr. Erik Nielsen (Yukon): Mr. Speaker, I perhaps tra-

velled f arther than any other member of the House of
Commons to get here, and it would be inappropriate if I
did not say a word or two about somne others who have
been completely overlooked in the f ew days during which
this debate has been going on. If it were not for the
communications network that was maintairted by the CN
in the Yukon Territory and the Northwest Territories we
would have had virtually no communication with the
outside world, electronically at least. That network has
been maintained during the strike by supervisors most of
whom were workers at one time. Therefore, I think I
would be remiss if I did not extend our appreciation to
those supervisors who provided the service to these of ten
forgotten areas of Canada.

Mr. Speaker: Is the House ready for the question?

Somne hon. Memnbers: Question.

Mr. Speaker: All those in favour of the motion wil
please say yea.

Somne hon. Memnbers: Yea.

Mr. Speaker: Ahl those opposed will please say nay.

Somne hon. Memnbers: Nay.

Mr. Speaker: In my opinion the yeas have it.

And more than five members having risen:

Mr. Speaker: Caîl in the members.

The House divided on the motion (Mr. Munro, Hamilton
East) which was agreed to on the following division:
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