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every department of the Government, over the Subjects of British 
origin, who, except in Quebec and Montreal, and in the Townships, 
might be said to be scattered in weak unconnected parties through­
out the Seigniorial Grants of the King of France, and the Roman 
Catholic Parishes.

Among the characteristics of the Canadien Newspaper, should be 
particularly mentioned the mixture of abuse of the local Govern­
ment, and of the British Settlers, with exaggerated expressions of 
loyalty to the King, and devotion to the Imperial Government, who 
were always represented as friendly to the ascendancy of the French 
Canadians, and to the full developetnent of a Constitution, which fa­
cilitated to the latter, an exclusive domination in Legislation and 
Finance, while it impeded the Anglification of the Colony, and the 
resort of all Settlers of British origin.

During the General Election of Members for the fifth House of 
Assembly, in June 1808, the disappointment of Mr. J. A. Panel, in 
his expectation of being re-elected for the City of Quebec, ascribed 
to Executive intrigue, produced « such opprobrious violence in the 
pages of the Canadien, as drew the attention of the Governor ; and 
Mr. Panet being one of its Patrons, he was dismissed from his Lieu­
tenant Colonelcy of the Militia, and received a private intimation 
from the Provincial Secretary, Mr. Poland, that this disgrace was 
owing to the seditious tendency of his Speeches and Writings insert­
ed in the Canadien Newspa'per.

The same Chapter next describes the firmness, find consis­
tency, with which Sir James Craig defended the position which his 
own principles and the conduct of the Majority at the Election, had 
detenjj^ned him to take in favourof the Subjects of British birth and 
originT; From this new and commending position, he reviewed the 
state of the Country, uninfluenced, Jar a time, by the temporising 
views of the Quebec Junta, and perceived with sorrow, the multipli­
ed grievances of the British population, and resolved to èxert him­
self for their redress. These grievances are detailed, and can bjK 
readily ascribed, by our intelligent readers, to the virtual exclusion 
of that population from influence in the jliouse of Assembly, andvo 
the inimical effects of French Laws upon British Colonisation, Com­
merce, and general improvement.

The Provincial Parliament was summoned to meet, for the des­
patch of business, on the 10th of April, 1809; and Mr. Panet hav­
ing Jjieen chosen Speaker, and contrary to expectation, approved by 
His Excellency, the Session was opened with a long Speech, in which 
the warlike exploits of Great Britain, and her unsatisfactory négocia­
tions with the United States, were reviewed, and Measures of do­
mestic Legislation were recommended for the permanent encourage­
ment of that industry, which the temporary stimulus of the Ameri­
can Embargo, and the influence of external, Commerce, had called 
forth. An interesting extract from His Excellency’s Speech, given
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