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Let 08 offer up the following prayers in Hononr
of the B. V. Mary, holy Mother of God, in hopes
she will recommend our few and feeble prayers to
her divine Son, and supply all our defects in them.
Oh

!
Most Amiable Mother of God, life passes

swiftly away and death approaches. Oh I when
that awful moment arrives, be though unto us, we
beseech a most tender mDther, and dispose of the
Heart of thy blessed Son favourably towards us.
Hail Mary.

Oh 1 Most holy and Adorable Trinity, as it was
by thee we began our devotions, so it is by the 3
we desire to conclude them. Suffer us not to
depart this night without thy blessing

j
give it to

us. Oh I Merciful Father, and may it always re-
main with us, and may its influence always direct
our actions, and may it be a sure pledge of that
final benediction which thine elect will one day
receive when called by thee to thy Kmgdom of
Eternal Glory.

Let us conclude our present devotions this night
by placing ourselves under the protection of Jesu?,
Maiy and Joseph. May the peace and blessing
of Almighty Gjd Father, Son and Holy Ghost,
deeeend down on us, and dwell in our hearts now
and for ever more. Amen. In the name of the
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be to the f '^'^^^h »on f^d Holy Ghost. Amen.


